From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>

Subject: Re: Invoice Question

Date: Thu, 20 Sep 2018 12:33:11 +0000

can you tell me where we stand dock permits 7 cable permits ete. ?

On Thu, Sep 20, 2018 at 7:55 AM, Amy Dcmpﬁum wrote:
 am doing invoices today, should [ send my invoice through Ernbia or direct to you guys.

Amy Claire Dempsey, MLA,
President, Bioimpact, Inc.

PO Box 132 Kingshill

st Croix, US. Virgin [slands 00851

and time frame.
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