From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
To: Richard Kahn *—-“-*
Subject: Re: Flagpole pool awning
Date: Tue, 18 Sep 2018 18:49:10 +0000

confirmed

On Tue, Sep 18, 2018 at 2:48 PM, Richard Kahn fi_'-'-* wrote:

attached 1s awning brice ordered on friday...which 1s 20" wide with a 10° projection

kvle and daphne were requesting quotes of an exact replacement of existing which was 14" wide with an 8’
projection

please confirm size brice ordered is ok
thank you

Richard Kahn
HBEEK Associates Inc.

e

Begin forwarded message:

From: Daphne Wallace {_;

Subject: Fwd: Your Awntech Corporation order receipt from September 14, 2018
Date: September 18, 2018 at 3:39:03 PM EDT

To: Rich Kahn <[ -

—————————— Forwarded message ------—--

Date: Fri, Sep 14, 2018 at 3:27 PM
Subject: Fwd: Your Awntech Corporation order receipt from September 14, 2018
To: LS G5J <

Ce: Kvle reavis =

o

Fyl
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—————— - Forwarded message ------—-

From: Awntech Corporation <] G-

Date: Fri, Sep 14, 2018 at 3:24 PM

Subject: Your Awntech Corporation order receipt from September 14, 2018

g

To:

shown below for your reference:

Product

Hampton

Fabric:

White - D1-W

Size :

20" Wide x 10' Projection
$1,400.00

Crank Type:
Right Motor $300.00

Mount Type 20"
Woall Mount Brackets - No
Additional Charges

Valance:
Straight

Add Remote Wind Sensor
$199.95

Fabric: White - D1-W
Size : 20" Wide x 10°
Projection $1,400.00

Crank Type: Right Motor
$300.00

Mount Type 20" Wall
Mount Brackets - No
Additional Charges

Valance: Straight

Quantity

Thank you for your order

Your order has been received and is now being processed. Your order details are

Order #11012 (September 14, 2018)

Price

$3,099.90
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Product

Add Remote Wind Sensor

$199.95

Subtotal:

Shipping:

Payment method:

Total:

MNote:

Billing address

LSJE.LLC

575 Lexington Ave
New York, NY 10022

I'he Saint James Group

USVI

please note

Quantity  Price

$3,099.90

$125.00 via Amount
Credit or Debit Checkout
$3,224.90

FYI this order is going to
freight forward for shipping
to USVI

Shipping address

LSJE.LLC St Thomas
Tropical Shipping

9505 NW 108th Avenue
Medley, FL 33178
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The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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