
From: Richard Kahn
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Nanna Tubes 
Date: Tue, 18 Sep 2018 18:03:28 +0000 

carlos requested 7/24 and paid 7/26 after your approval so actually 6 weeks now 
carlos should be following projects from start to finish and not just requesting checks.. 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
Ne 
tel 
fa 
cel 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Carlos Rodriguez 
Subject: Re: Nanna Tubes 
Date: September 17, 2018 at 3:33:10 PM EDT 
To: Richard KahnnlaillIPPIMPOPIW,  "Jeffrey E." < 

Greetings Sir I requested the deposit on the 24th of July, tube was removed and shipped shortly after, will find exact date and 
communicate back with info. 
thankyou 
Carlos 

On Monday, September 17, 2018, 3:14:03 PM AST, Jeffrey E. leevacationOgmail.com> wrote: 

when did it start? 

On Mon, Sep 17, 2018 at 2:59 PM, Carlos Rodriguez wrote: 
Greetings Sir, I spoke to offshore, they stated our tube is in the making . they will try to expedite the process to get done 
as soon as possible. 
thankyou,respectfully 
Carlos. 

On Monday, September 17, 2018, 9:34:36 AM AST, Jeffrey E. <jeevacationegmail.com> wrote: 

that is one month ?? why so long? 

On Mon, Sep 17, 2018 at 9:23 AM, Carlos Rodriguez  rote: 
Greetings all,l had a conversation with Aubrey Cilliers owner of Offshore marine, He hopes to have Nanna done on the 
15th of October. The plan is to remove tubes on spouts as soon as Nanna is returned to us. 
Thankyou 
Carlos 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationagmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationOgmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA01022676


