
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn • 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Tue, 18 Sep 2018 13:10:43 +0000 

what is his number , I told you to pay this as i think casner is dangerous. thx 

On Tue, Sep 18, 2018 at 9:09 AM, Richard Kahn < 
you should call jeanne regarding this invoice 

is checking out and impossible to deal with!! 
if i do not agree with him 1000% he flies off the handle 

Richard Kahn 

fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: > 
Subject: Re: 
Date: September 18, 2018 at 9:04:39 AM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn < 
Cc: Daphne Wallace < >, Jeanne Brennan < 
E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Excuse me till ,
No more attacks 
I'm done 
Thank you 

Sent from my iPhone 

wrote: 

On Sep 18, 2018, at 8:51 AM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 

>, "Jeffrey 

i just spoke with Jeanne who informed me how ridiculous this invoice is as it was not a salvage 
operation 
Please speak with Kasner again today regarding this invoice 
Thank you 
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Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

tel 
fax 
cell 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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