
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn < >, Kyle reavis

Subject: Re: Pool Start Date 
Date: Mon, 17 Sep 2018 17:57:13 +0000 

no drain pool monday 

On Mon, Sep 17, 2018 at 1:49 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 
start date appears to be end of the week..with promise to by done by Sep 29th 
Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Kyle reavis  fr" 
Subject: Re: Pool Start Date 
Date: September 17, 2018 at 1:31:49 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 

Rich, 

Rick just called me (after your email) and said he "should be out Thursday or Friday" . I am going to drain 
the pool for him tomorrow in preparation of his start date. He told me he is behind schedule right now but he 
is promising us that our end date will still be met, before the end of September. Let me know what you think. 

Kyle 

On Mon, Sep 17, 2018 at 10:19 AM, Richard Kahn < 
any update on our start date? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

wrote: 
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On Sep 14, 2018, at 12:13 PM, Richard Kahn < 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Sep 14, 2018, at 11:25 AM, Rick Rossi < 

> wrote: 

> wrote: 

I'll get there as soon as I can , I'll let you know . I have a few things that must be finished before I can 
get to LSJ. 
Hoping to have the pool completed before 9/29 
Rick 

On Fri, Sep 14, 2018 at 9:24 AM Richard Kahn
Rick please advise on start date 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Sep 13, 2018, at 9:59 AM, Kyle reavis 

Rick, 

What will be our start date now? 

> wrote: 

> wrote: 
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Kyle 

On Thu, Sep 13, 2018 at 6:55 AM, Rick Rossi < > wrote: 
Good day . 
I need to push back to start date by a few days , Need to finish up a few projects . Due to the 
threat of Issac coming our way ,it caused a delay in my crews arrival from the states . They were 
stuck here for last years storms and did not want to chance that again . This will not effect getting 
the pool completed on time as I allotted extra time . 
Thank you 
Rick Rossi 

On Wed, Sep 5, 2018 at 8:33 AM Richard Kahn < > wrote: 
thank you for update 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Sep 5, 2018, at 6:38 AM, Rick Rossi < > wrote: 

Good day Mr. Kahn , 
We plan on starting on the 17th Sept. The lights were ordered yesterday . 
The lights are $605.99 each or $1817.97 plus 20% = $2181.56 Shipping cost not known 
yet. 
Rick 

On Tue, Sep 4, 2018 at 9:15 PM Richard Kahn < 
thanks for update 
please send invoice for lights before purchasing 

do we have a confirmed start date? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

> wrote: 
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On Aug 30, 2018, at 2:44 PM, Rick Rossi < > wrote: 

Deposit for pool work has arrived .Thank you . Materials will be ordered . Also while on 
the Island Michael Glidden (electrician ) Wanted me to order new lights for the pool . 
These will be ordered . Cost plus 20% will be added to final invoice . 
Thanks 
Rick 

On Mon, Aug 27, 2018 at 12:39 PM Rick Rossi < wrote: 
Yes we can keep the dates the same. I will be changing the price back to pre bundle 
price. I'll send an invoice for a deposit. I was about to order some materials this morning 
and luckily got called away before order was finalized. I do hope this is the last of the 
changes. 
Rick 

On Mon, Aug 27, 2018 at 11:39 AM Kyle reavis < > wrote: 
Good Morning Rick, 

As of this morning the scope has changed back to the flag pole pool only to be 
refinished. Please let me know if the start date is still the same as before, Sep 17th. 
Thank you! 

Very Respectfully, 

Kyle W Reavis 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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