
From: Lawrence Krauss

To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationggmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Invoice from KaiserDillon PLLC - Krauss 

Date: Fri, 07 Sep 2018 20:39:03 +0000 

Attachments: 09-04-18_Inv._Krauss.pdf 

I forgot to send the details.. I don't know how to maintain this. 

Lawrence M. Krauss 
Professor 
School of Earth & Space Exploration and Physics Department 
A 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: KaiserDillon Billing < 
Subject: Invoice from KaiserDillon PLLC - Krauss 
Date: Se tember 7, 2018 at 11:27:37 AM PDT 
To: ' 
Cc: Justin Dillon < >, Matthew Kaiser < 

Dear Dr. Krauss: 

Thank you for letting us be of service to you. 

Attached is your invoice for legal services through August 31, 2018. 

Your retainer account is exhausted and you have a balance of $24,261.50. Please remit payment in the amount of 
$39,261.50 to replenish your retainer to the previously agreed amount of $15,000.00. 

If you would like to pay by check, please send a check to our address: 

KaiserDillon PLLC 

If you would like to make an online payment, please click on the following link to make a secure online payment: 

If you have any questions, please feel free to call us at 

KaiserDillon PLLC 
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