
From: Kyle reavis 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
Cc: BMG < >, Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: end of summer begiing of completion 
Date: Tue, 04 Sep 2018 12:19:52 +0000 

Attachments: LSJ 2 bathrooms enclosed.docx 

Good Morning, 

Jay is saying 1.5 months for bathrooms and his bid for both bathrooms was 55K. Expert Builders is promising 
pricing on the bathrooms today by EOB. Jay is preparing a price per ft for our road projects. Dupson is not 
finished yet but is telling me this week he should be done, he had to source more stone. After he is done with the 
dock do you want him to do the pool wall to match the existing? Q-Hut concrete will be poured either Thursday 
or Saturday depending on St John Concretes schedule, they are confirming now. They are the only company 
here with trucks big enough to get up that grade of gravel road. Hardware is special order and 6 weeks out, 
Daphne and I are checking to see if we can 3 sets anywhere else to finish the library and office. 

Very Respectfully, 

Kyle W Reavis 

On Tue, Sep 4, 2018 at 5:05 AM Jeffrey E. <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 
shower schedule? all hardware arrived? . take photos of the barge landing. ? please. . dupson finsh the 
dock . ? french drains? lights. ? brice talk to rich about trees for main. . lets talk with rich abvout RO 
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