
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Fri, 31 Aug 2018 17:40:19 +0000 

medical expenses or tuition always ok no matter how large 

On Fri, Aug 31, 2018 at 1:35 PM, 
I understand Dear Jeffrey , 
I'm very grateful for everything you have done for me . 
You are always will be my friend. 
Will see you after the trip . 

> wrote: 

On Thursday, August 30, 2018, 5:50:13 PM EDT, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

your suppport from me will need to end in december . ill explain when i see you 
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