From: Richard Kahn <
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Fwd: Jesus Andujar - Conversation - January 15, 2019

Date: Tue, 15 Jan 2019 17:42:24 +0000

Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor

Begin forwarded message:

From: Daphne Wallace </ -

Subject: Jesus Andujar - Conversation - January 15, 2019

Date: January 9, 2019 at 11:56:33 AM EST
To: Rich Kahn < >, Darren Indyke <[ G- .

Greetings Rich,
MNotes from my meeting with Mr. Jesus M. Andujar (Omega Services):

1. JMA guoted to re-wire back end of Generator - 515,000 - August &, 2018 (note: at end of meeting JMA said
he had the part for about 2 months prior, awaiting a decision from MG on whether LSJ wanted JMA to quote
and complete the job)

2. LST gives IMA a deposit of $8,000 - August 8, 2018

3. JMA cleans up and paints the back end - sends photos to MG - August 9, 2018

4. IMA orders the wiring - arrives 2 weeks later, the wrong gauge (14 not 15 gauge) - August 23, 2018
{approximate)

5. IMA informs MG, Boscoe, Randy and Ashley (Plan B contractors) that the wiring is incorrect - must be
reordered

6. IMA receives the correct wiring, begins to work on project - mid-September, 2018 (approximate)

7. Boscoe stops in one time to JMA to see progress - both discuss the complication of the job - will take time
8. IMA completes the job, texts MG to please call him, the job is completed - November 5, 2018

0. IMA still trying to contact MG, no response - November 22, 2018

0. IMA gets no response from MG, comes to STC to seek help in contacting MG - between November 26 and
December 14, 2018

10. T contact MG to tell him JMA came to the office please call him, he tells me he has blocked his calls - took
too long for the job

11. IMA calls the office, I put him on hold, call MG and offer to conference them in, MG says no he will call
him directly
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12. Per IMA, MG called him and told him to keep the part, it is no longer needed
I also have a recording (13:26 minutes) of the meeting, and a copy of the texts that IMA sent to MG.

JMA has the part, shrink-wrapped and secured at his shop. He told me that he would hold the part for a year.

Kind regards, Daphne
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