
From: J <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Bella Klein • 
Subject: Re: 

Date: Mon, 21 Jan 2019 17:43:22 +0000 

> 

its ok, ill pay 

On Mon, Jan 21, 2019 at 12:31 PM Bella Klein < > wrote: 

Uber charge is for =1, she will repay with a check as trip was charged to your account in error. 

Thank you, 

Bella 

On Jan 21, 2019, at 8:58 AM, J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

i see an uber charge on my card, this moring? 
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