
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 

To: Anastasiya Siro 

Subject: Re: shares purchase agreement- Magnus 

Date: Sat, 09 Sep 2017 16:47:12 +0000 

Inline-Images: image00ljpg 

Can you call me 

On Sat, Sep 9, 2017 at 6:44 PM Anastasiya Siro > wrote: 
yes, was signed by me back at the date. I have hard copy somewhere at my home. Was not notarized as far as I 
know. 

Will ask about the rest. 
Talk soon, 

-A 

ANASTASIYA SIRO 

HOUSE OF THE NOBLEMAN LTD 
STUDIO HOUSE, 38 HILL ROAD 
LONDON NW8 9CIE 

Unless otherwise stated, all designs, logos, images or other content contained in this e-mail are protected by copyright and other intellectual 
property rights belonging to two create, its affiliates or its licensors and all such rights are hereby asserted and reserved. Nothing contained in this e-
mail shall be construed as granting any license to use any such rights without the written consent of two create. This transmission is confidential 
and intended solely for the person or organisation to whom it is addressed. It may contain privileged and confidential information. If you are not the 
intended recipient, you should not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance on it. If you have received this transmission in error, please notify 
the sender. 

On Sep 9, 2017, at 12:31 PM, jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

did it ever get signed ,if so where are the signed copies notarized. etc. ? were share certificates issued?, if 
so where are they? , were stock transfer doc produced, ? received? etc. this has not even been proof 
read.. there is no info on how many shares outstaniding and even a blind agent will see that the notice to 
sellers and buyers are reversed. jon you said 300k got wired, what dates. we saw only 200k. 
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On Sat, Sep 9, 2017 at 6:11 PM, Anastasiya Siro < wrote: 
Hello, 

Please find attached 

Thank you! 

-A 
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