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it happens 

On Tue, Jan 29, 2019 at 6:02 PM Richard Kahn • 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax=
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Stephanie Remington 
Subject: Re: Anna projects on GSJ / LSJ 
Date: January 29, 2019 at 11:54:29 AM EST 
To: Richard Kahn < 
Cc: Ann Rodriquez < 

wrote: 

I am sorry to report than while attempting with our CAT to move the rack with the large counter top for the 
FPPool kitchen to a location where it could be retrieved by the lull, the piece was damaged. Kenny will order 
a replacement part ASAP but he said it will be at least a month before it is ready for install. 

Stephanie Remington 
LSJE, LLC 

On Tue, 29 Jan 2019 at 08:55, Stephanie Remington <MMIlla> wrote: 
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Old countertops removed. New countertops in progress. They worked Saturday. Took some tops home to 
work on over the weekend. Haven't seen them since because they were working in their shop. Should be 
on the 9 o'clock barge this morning. I'll ask Cashkim to take photos periodically when he is here as well to 
help keep you up to date. Photos attached. 

On Tue, Jan 29, 2019 at 8:35 AM Richard Kahn < wrote: 
stephanie not helpful giving an update tuesday morning without pictures and vague information... 
next time please give timely updates as you promised you would on friday morning.. 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York,  NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

On Jan 29, 2019, at 7:31 AM, Stephanie Remington < > wrote: 

They worked Saturday and took some tops home to work on in their shop over the rest of the weekend. 
They are coming back today. 

Stephanie Remington 
LSJE, LLC 

On Mon, 28 Jan 2019 at 19:05, Richard Kahn wrote: 
stephanie please update on kenny and his work from this weekend.. 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

New York NY 10022 
tel

xafl
cel
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On Jan 25, 2019, at 7:04 AM, Stephanie Remington < > wrote: 

Thank you, Anna. I'm happy to check on Kenny and send photos. Working this weekend is no 
problem. Other contractors will be here along with some of our crew. 

On Fri, Jan 25, 2019 at 7:17 AM Ann Rodriquez < wrote: 

GSJ Landscapers: 
Nicholas & Sainfrance who normally stay on GSJ are lining the roads by hand (No equipment 
needed) 

Painter: 
TJ will re-do the step strips by hand. (No equipment needed) 

Heavy Equipment: 
Jules and Buck are cleaning around Mikes cottage & the generator shed. (Trackhoe & Roller) 

Should I come over to LSJ today to check on Kenny? Someone need to keep Rich & Bossman 
updated on Kenny with Photos. Please speak with Kenny. He would like to work this weekend to 
be completed by Monday. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 25, 2019, at 5:18 AM, Stephanie Remington < > wrote: 

This is great news, Anna. Please confirm who among the crew and heavy equipment needed. 

On Thu, 24 Jan 2019 at 18:55, Ann Rodriquez < > wrote: 
will do. 
At the moment it's just GSJ main roads & the step strips. Both projects should be 100% 
completed by tomorrow. 

Ann R. 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Jan 24, 2019, at 6:47 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

> anna please coordinate with stephanie in advance the work you will be performing so 
stephanie can coordinate existing crews and equipment 
> thank you 

> Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 

> New York, NY 10022 
> tel 
> fax 
> cell 
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Stephanie Remington 
LSJE, LLC 

Stephanie Remington 
LSJE, LLC 

Stephanie Remington 
LSJE, LLC 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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