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she is right please send 

On Fri, Feb 1, 2019 at 8:04AM EM= wrote: 

, hello, how are you? 
I contacted with the school 
And they explained that 2k is a deposit that students pay 
when they are not in a rush and have time to prepare all 
the documents they need . So they told me that I need to 
contribute the remaining payment as I need to get the 
documents as soon as possible. 

I also received the money on my bank account so I attach 
screenshot from my bank . 
Thank you for your help! 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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