From: ] <jeevacation(@gmail.com>
To: Richard Kahn _}
Subject: Re: Bentley Update
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I think it should be on the vslue of the difference eith trade in

On Fri, Feb 1, 2019 at 7:47 PM Richard Kahn <} | R - o

they plan on fixing pebble damage and scratches in that price of 122,000 euro

attached are registrations fees / taxes totaling 15,960 Euro..
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please advise

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

975 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022
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On Feb 1, 2019, at 6:06 PM, ] <jeevacation(@gmail.com> wrote:

they have to fix the pebble paint damage . and take itif they do, we can pay a 5k deposit to fix the paint so

we see it before they send it.

On Fri, Feb 1, 2019 at 5:44 PM Richard Kahn <_ wrote:

MNegotiation currently at:

Price of Bentley 222,000 Euro
Less: trade (90,000)
Less: deposit (10.000)

Additional Cost 122,000 Euro

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

o975 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022
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please note
The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. 1t 15 the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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