
From: J <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: Larry Visoski 

Subject: Re: CPDLC for GIV $275-$350K 
Date: Fri, 08 Feb 2019 15:10:40 +0000 

Forward 

On Fri, Feb 8, 2019 at 11:00 AM Larry Visoski S. wrote: 
Jeffrey 
I spoke to the sales rep for Clay Lacy ref CPDLC Fansl A install on our GIV, 
I requested quick ref numbers, Low side $275k with a Max of $350k for installation of CPDLC., they are 
currently reviewing our Avionics equip list as we speak to formulate an accurate quote. 
I'll have the quote by Tuesday next week for your review, 
I will not fwd to buyer without your approval 
Just FYI at this point. 

Thx 
lorry 

Sent from my iPad 
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