From: Richard Kahn _}
To: ] <jeevacation{@gmail.com=
Subject: Re:
Date: Fri, 15 Feb 2019 14:47:24 +0000

Bella just sent wire.

Richard Kahn
HBEEK Associates Inc.

On Feb 15, 2019, at 9:37 AM, ] <jeevacation/@gmail.com> wrote:

can you wire 2500 dollars lU_ChHHE account
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