
From: Larry Visoski 
To: J <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: S76 offer 
Date: Wed, 13 Feb 2019 21:45:15 +0000 

Ok„ I tell him $2.9M 
Also, Darren Rothell called me, he said he was contacted by Jeff Greene to find him an S76, 
I told Darren to stay away from the heli we are looking at, he understood, and said, nothing will happen till next 
week with Greene, 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Feb 13, 2019, at 4:36 PM, J leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

he can put in the 2.9 offer if he prefers. 

On Wed, Feb 13, 2019 at 4:34 PM Larry Visoski c wrote: 
Jeffrey 
I told Matt the Broker that you would offer $3.1M for the Heli But $200k commish must come to me, so the 
purchase price would be $2.9M. 
He first said, he was willing to make this work„ then he became hesitant to present this to CVS being a 
public company, he thought CVS May think this is a shady procedure, and I was taking advantage of the 
situation „ I told Matt I had your direction„Matt also mentioned that if CVS hears your willing to pay 3.1, 
why isn't CVS getting that amount, 

Matt suggested that we pay $3.1 to escrow, and let escrow disperse the $200k commish but this only has the 
contract purchase price at $2.9M. 

Matt is will to present to CVS and his partner at Guardian wanted us aware of what CVS light think, 

I told him not to mention anything until I speak to you, I certainly didn't want to mess up the deal myself. 

Other idea, maybe run the purchase though Gary's company?? 

Not sure how to proceed? 
I will view the Helicopter in persons at Hartford CT tomorrow at I 0am with Matt the broker, 
I think it's best that I View the heli in person, not Pete, 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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