From: Larry Visoski <]} | | R
To: J <jeevacation(@gmail.com™>
Subject: Re:
Date: Wed, 13 Feb 2019 16:50:40 +0000

Ok.. I don’t know what to say,,
Thank you, I'll work it now

Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 13, 2019, at 11:22 AM, ] <jeevacation(crmail com> wrote:

you can tell the heli broker that we will pay 3.1 total but 200k needs to be paid to you as commission.  as

far as the public 15 concerned they will see a 3.1 price.
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