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it wont happen again  sorry, , we have a very different view

On Tue, Feb 12, 2019 at 3:17 PM Paul Barrett f_* wrote:

Jeffrey,

[ just spoke to Anthony. He said that you told him that I lost $10MM. Since inception net of fees the account

is up $1.46MM as of Jan 31°%. Feel free to add back the opportunity cost of selling Foundation Medicine which
gets 1t back to +- flat to down S500K-$1MM.

[ have been nothing but fair, reasonable and respectful with respect to all of our dealings. It is bad enough that
[ left JPM based on our agreement and you walked away from our deal leaving me in a tough financial
situation. Please do not make up numbers and tarnish my reputation.

Paul

Paul Barrett

Alpha Group Capital LLC

142 W 57 Street, 11 Floor, New York, NY 10019
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please note
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The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
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communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
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