
From: Daphne Wallace < 
To: J <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Cc: Richard Kahn
Subject: Re: 

Date: Wed, 13 Mar 2019 14:41:49 +0000 

Greetings Sir, 

Yes. 

I met with Craig this morning. He will be at a conference tomorrow, but he has notified his co-worker Ms. 
Aubain, and he instructed me on what to do: 

I. Complete the Affidavit and Renewal forms - I will complete and notarize, you will sign when you arrive. 
2. Pay the $54 fee - I will do so in the morning at the DMV prior to your arrival 
3. You will sign for your Real ID, Ms. Aubain will retrieve the ID from the Director's office and hand it to you. 

Respectfully, 

Daphne 

On Wed, Mar 13, 2019 at 9:33 AM J <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
i can pick up my real id tomrw at 1115- 1130 ? 
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