
From: J <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
To: Larry Visoski -Ma> 

Subject: Re: N722JE Pre-Buy quote 
Date: Fri, 08 Mar 2019 21:15:24 +0000 
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Matt , 1 what do you suggest? 2 we are ready to close . 3 

On Fri, Mar 8, 2019 at 4:04 PM Larry Visoski c wrote: 
Jeffrey 
Attached is the Prebuy quote from AAG which covers all inspection and hourly items come due soon on S76. 
I need to speak to Chuck the Maintence Director at Aetna to confirm exact due dates of these inspections 

The float bottles alone are Parts and should considered Sellers item, cost $57,273.32 

Labor for inspections $94,400 
Parts $64,755.29 

Thx 
Lany 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Matt Walter
Date: March 8, 2019 at 2:20:12 PM EST 
To: Larry Visoski
Subject: RE: N722JE Pre-Buy quote 

Larry — all of these items cannot be done as the pre-buy. It is far far far too large of an inspection scope for this 
transaction. This was a low priced helicopter that was supposed to be a quick deal. A 650 hour inspection that costs 
$160k does not represent that. This is not doable. Call me when you land so we can discuss. 

Thank you, 

For a complete list of our current aircraft inventory, visit us online at 
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From: Larry Visoski mailto 
Sent: Friday, March 08, 2019 2:17 PM 
To: Matt Walter 
Subject: Fwd: N722JE Pre-Buy quote 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Rao, Alexander .1" 
Date: March 8, 2019 at 1:48:40 PM EST 
To: Larry Visoski
Subject: N722JE Pre-Buy quote 

Good afternoon Larry, 

Please see the attached quote. Let me know if you have any concerns. Thank you and have a great weekend. 

Alex Rao 

Production Control Coordinator 

ASSOCIATED AIRCRAFT GROUP I SIKORSKY SHARES 

Tele: 845.790.0189 

Cell: 845.3O9.1986 

Email: 

Fractional Ownership. Aircraft Management. Charter Services. Aircraft Maintenance 
VIP Platinum Solutions. Experience the Difference. 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA01030868


