
From: J <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn 

Subject: Re: Order receipt #116970 
Date: Fri, 08 Mar 2019 15:48:19 +0000 

Inline-Images: logojpg; spacergie kblogo.jpg 

he can , there are lights. 

On Fri, Mar 8, 2019 at 10:24 AM Richard Kahn > wrote: 
you will see charge on your phone for amex charge 7,978 for 2 toilets i just ordered for PBI 

waiting for merwin to confirm he can get electric in 2 bathrooms at 71st and then i will order 2 more for NYC.. 

Richard Kahn 

1111111oor 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: : Order receipt #116970 
Date: March 8, 2019 at 10:23:18 AM EST 
To: 
Reply-To: 

You have received this notification from because you are a registered user or you or some other 
registered user requested some information for you from our store. 
Dear Jeffrey Epstein, 
Thank you for your order. Please come back soon! 
Receipt: 

RECEIPT 
Date: 03/08/2019 10:23 
AM 
Order id: #116970 
Order status: Pre-
Authorized 
Payment method: 
Credit Card 
Delivery method: 
Free Shipping (Orders 

331 37th Street, Brooklyn 
11232, New York 

United States 
CALL US: 1.800.634.0410 

Email: 

EFTA01030911



less than $299 have 
Handling Charge) 

Email: 
Phone number: 

Billing address Shipping address 

First name: Jeffrey First name: Jeffrey 
Last name: Epstein Last name: Epstein 
Address: 358 El Brillo Way Address: 358 El Brillo Way 
City: Palm Beach City: Palm Beach 
State: Florida State: Florida 
Country: United States Country: United States 
Zip/Postal code: 33480 Zip/Postal code: 33480 
Phone: 2129711306 Phone: 2129711306 
Fax: Fax: 

Products ordered 

SIW 1—arProduct  Item price Quantity Total 

MS992CUMFG#01-
SPECIAL 

TOTO NEOREST700H TANKLESS 
MS992CUMFG DUAL RUSH TOILET WITH 
INTEGRATED WASHLET SEAT AND 
EWATER. MS992CUMFG#01"" MONTHLY 
SPECIAL DEAL 

$3989.00 2 $7978.00 

Subtotal: 57978.00 

Handling Charge: $0.00 

Total: 57978.00 

Thank you for your purchase! 

Phone: 1-800-634-0410 
URL: 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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