From: Richard Kahn <||| |
To: Joscha Bach <] -
Subject: Re: Alto International School Tuition
Date: Wed, 06 Mar 2019 18:40:38 +0000

Ok thanks for the updates. Please keep me posted on the financial aid.

Richard Kahn

HBRE Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

Phone 212-971-1306

Fax 646-350-0954

Cell

On Mar 6, 2019, at 1:30 PM, Joscha Bach *i'_ wrote:

<Invoice-3410.pdf=

It seems that the 2550 per child are composed of a 2000 USD tuition deposit and a 550 USD enrolment fee.
The fee 1s mentioned here:
https:Valtoschool org/tuition-financial-aid/

I will ask the school to confirm that. We will be applying for financial aid and will let you know about the
outcome.

Thank vou!

— Joscha

On Mar 6, 2019, at 08:19, Richard Kahn *f_} wrote:

Please contact school as i thought we left a 5100 deposit for both kids which would be a 2550 credit on stmt
not 2100 as shown

(Can you also inquire about financial aid from Alto International School

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

EFTA01031275



575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022
tel 212-971-1306

fax 212-320-0381

=

On Feb 28, 2019, at 7:03 PM, Joscha Bach H_ wrote:

Begin forwarded message:

From: Alto Billing <|| -

Subject: Alto International School Tuition

Date: February 27, 2019 at 11:46:20 PST

1 o " "
. - "
[o: "_ 1 —
<] [

Hello Mira and Joscha,
We are excited to have Aino and Taiyo joining Alto International School.

Please see the two prorated invoices, and tuition summaries attached. Please drop off check payment at the
school for tuition due by the 12th of March.
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Please let me know if you have any questions or need anything else. Thank you!

Sincerely,

Henry

Henry Serper
Senior Accountant | Moss CPA
1901 Olympic Boulevard | Suite 200 | Walnut Creek, CA 94596

Phone: (925) 482-2637 | Fax: (925) 482-2620

<Aino.pdf=
<Taiyo.pdf=
<Tuwtion Letter - Bach, Aino.pdf=

<Tuition Letter - Bach, Taiyo.pdf=
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