From: ] <jeevacation(@gmail.com>
To: Richard Kahn _}
Subject: Re: Bougainvillea and Ficus - February 28, 2019
Date: Thu, 28 Feb 2019 14:31:17 +0000
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On Thu, Feb 28, 2019 at 9:09 AM Richard Kahn <[ - o<

please advise if you would like to proceed with (12) ficus (@ 150 each as well as Barbara karr bougaimnvillea.
arrival on LSJ 3/22
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
MNew York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: Daphne Wallace <|| -
Subject: Bougainvillea and Ficus - February 28, 2019
Date: February 28, 2019 at 9:56:08 AM EST

To: Dupson Donissaint <. Rich K2 <

Greetings DD,

I spoke with CIiff this morning - he has 45-47 units of the 45 gallon Barbara Karr bougainvillea. [ told him
we will take them all - the 45 gallon size only. If he finds the balance in 45 gallon to complete the 50 count,
we will take them - but right now after he counted vesterday there are 45 for sure, maybe 47 units.

Attached also 1s a photo of the ficus that Cliff has in stock - 6-7 feet - 5150 per unit. He has the 12 that yvou
requested.

CHff plans to load week after next - 3/14 for a sail on Friday, 3/15. EDA on STT would be 3/19 - LS] could
pick up on Friday, 3/22.

Cost:
45 - 45 gallon "Barbara Kurst" bougainvillea (@ $150 each = % 6,750.00
12 - 6-7 foot Ficus (@ $150 each = 51.800.00
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Kind regards, DW

e ie:

please note
The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationf@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

$ 8,550.00
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