From: Richard Kahn *—-}
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Piney Woods refund
Date: Thu, 14 Mar 2019 13:16:28 +0000

still chasing [l to receive refund.. .been 6 + weeks she has left the school..
unfortunately no urgency when it is your money...

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fax
cell

Begin forwarded message:

From: Ann Rodriguez v}

Subject: Re: AMEX & VISA: Receipts from Jan-Feb
Date: March 13, 2019 at 6:17:53 PM EDT

To: Richard Kahn <

Cc: Bella Klein <

=

>, Daphne Wallace </ -

Mo response as vet. I"ve left several messages. | just called again but Voicemail.
I will call the Dean of Piney Woods tomorrow morning or all day until I reach someone.

Sent from my iPhone

On Mar 13, 2019, at 5:21 PM, Richard Kahn f- wrote:

any update on refund check?
please advise
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fax
cell

EFTA01032980



On Mar 5, 2019, at 5:37 PM, Ann Rodriquez *’_} wrote:

No. [ was told that Ms. Gaylord won’t be in until Thursday. [ will call back Thursday morning at 9am

Piney Woods School _

Sent from my iPhone

On Mar 5, 2019, at 6:16 PM, Richard Kahn *’_} wrote:

any word from Piney Woods?
please advise
thanks

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel

cell

On Mar 1, 2019, at 6:05 PM, Ann Rodriquez f_} wrote:

Yes, I sent an email and 1 spoke to Ms. Gaylord.
Ms. Gaylord is awaiting the directors approval.

During Bossman's last visit.

He asked me to have Piney Woods reimburse the check in my name. So [ sent a second email but no
answer as yet. [ will follow up with Piney Woods again on Monday

I can sign the check over to whomever 1f a refund 1s 1ssued.

Ann R,

Sent from my iPhone

On Mar 1, 2019, at 5:50 PM, Richard Kahn f_ wrote:

looks good

EFTA01032981



thank you

regarding piney woods are we able to get back 3,256 paid..
can you please inguire if you have not done so already
thanks
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Richard Kahn
HBRE Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel
fax
cell

EFTA01032982



