From: ] <jeevacationf@gmail.com>
To: Richard Kahn Hx—-“-*
Subject: Re: Invoice Boschulte
Date: Fri, 22 Mar 2019 21:58:55 +0000
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Ok

On Fri, Mar 22, 2019 at 10:44 PM Richard Kahn *»—-‘e“ wrote:
Dupson approved all the dates were correct and work performed
[ will process and pay invoice unless you have any concerns..
Please advise
Thank you

Richard Kahn

HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Tel
Fa:
Cel

Begin forwarded message:

From: "James Boschulte, Ir." <] GG
Date: March 22, 2019 at 12:13:29 PM MDT

To: Richard Kahn <

Subject: Re: Invoice Boschulte

Good Day Mr Kahn,
Please find the attached invoice for landscape work at Little St. James.
Thank you,

James Boschulte Jr
Manager

On Mar 15, 2019 2:52 PM, "Richard Kahn" ﬂi_'-'-* wrote:

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022
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On Mar 15, 2019, at 2:50 PM, James Boschulte, Jr. *1'_'-* wrote:

Good day,
I'll send it this weekend.
Thanks

James

On Mar 15, 2019 2:47 PM, "Richard Kahn" &_° wrote:

we still have not received an invoice
can you please send
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York. NY 10022

.
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The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use. disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof 1s strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationfagmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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