From: Richard Kahn *—-}
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Fwd: Invoice Boschulte
Date: Fri, 22 Mar 2019 21:28:15 +0000
Inline-Images: IMG 20190322 141011875,)pg

Dupson approved all the dates were correct and work performed
I will process and pay invoice unless you have any concemns..
Please advise

Thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: "James Boschulte, Jr." <] GG
Date: March 22, 2019 at 12:13:29 PM MDT

To: Richard Kahn <

Subject: Re: Invoice Boschulte

Good Day Mr Kahn,

Please find the attached invoice for landscape work at Little St. James.

Thank vou,

James Boschulte Jr

Manager

Boschulte Landscaping, LLC
Cell 340-344-2192

On Mar 15, 2019 2:52 PM, "Richard Kahn" *_'-* wrote:

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRE Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

EFTA01035157



On Mar 15, 2019, at 2:50 PM, James Boschulte, Jr. *i_-} wrote:

Good day,
I'll send it this weekend.
Thanks

James

On Mar 15, 2019 2:47 PM, "Richard Kahn" fi_'-'-* wrote:
we still have not received an invoice
can you please send
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

EFTA01035158



