
From: J <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

To: ann rodriquez 

Subject: Re: Anna: Loan request 

Date: Fri, 22 Mar 2019 18:59:01 +0000 

Of course 

On Fri, Mar 22, 2019 at 7:51 PM ann rodriquez < > wrote: 
I just got a call from Bella. Thank you so much! 

Mn R. 
DISCLAIMER: The information contained In this e-mail may be privileged,confldential, and protected from 
disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, 
distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 

On Friday, March 22, 2019 11:11:35 AM -04, Mn Rodriquez c › wrote: 

Hey Bossman, 

Can I please borrow $1,000 loan to pay Big Lom Sewage for my septic at the house? 

Septic backed-up in the house last night and this moming. 

-House Septic: 10,000 gallons 
-Loan request $1,000.00: for 6,000 gallons 
-3 septic runs needed $1,500.00 

$500 for 3000 gallon truck. I promise to pay back asap 

Mn R. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 19, 2019, at 3:05 PM, J leevacationO agn n> wrote: 

Give to ana 

On Tue, Mar 19, 2019 at 8:04 PM ann rodriquez wrote: 
Hi Rich, 

I finally received an answer from Piney Woods today.... 

Good Afternoon Ms Rodriquez, 

I am so sorry for the delay in replying to your request for a refund. I had to do some research to determine 
what amount is owed to you. I have found the following information as it pertains to your refund request: 

"For a student withdrawing between week I and week 4, Piney Woods may refund (at the School's sole discretion) 
not more than 80% of the assessed and paid annual tuition amount. In the unlikely event that a refund is determined 
to be issued, (in the sole discretion of the School,) refunds will be calculated on tuition and fees assessed for the year. 
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Any refund due to the student will be computed by the School; refunds are made payable to the parent or legal 
guardian. Refunds are normally processed within thirty days after the end of each month." 

Since you have been patiently waiting for more than one month, I will expedite the request. Your refund amount is 
$1,102.40. This amount was calculated as follows: 
Tuition - $1,378.00 + Registration Fee (non-refundable) - $250.00 = $1,628.00 
80% of $1,378.00 is $1,102.40 {calculated off of Tuition only because the Registration Fee is non-refundable}. 

I will be sure to email you once the refund has been processed and ready to be sent. 

Thanking you in advance, 

Tanisha S Gaylord 
Tuition and Billing /Student Accounts Specialist 
Office of Fiscal Affairs 
The Piney Woods School 
5096 Highway 49 South 
Pine oods MS 148 

Fo ow us on octal Media... 
Faceboolc The Piney Woods School 
Instagram: @thepineywoodsschool 
Twitter: @PWS1909 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and protected 
from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, 
distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 

On Wednesday, March 13, 2019 06:17:53 PM -04, Ann Rodriquez wrote: 

No response as yet. I've left several messages. I just called again but Voicemail. 

I will call the Dean of Piney Woods tomorrow morning or all day until I reach someone. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 13, 2019, at 5:21 PM, Richard Kahn .t: > wrote: 

any update on refund check? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York. NY 10022 
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On Mar 5, 2019, at 5:37 PM, Ann Rodriquez < wrote: 

No. I was told that Ms. Gaylord won't be in until Thursday. I will call back Thursday morning at 9am 

Piney Woods School-

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 5, 2019, at 6:16 PM, Richard Kahn ct > wrote: 

any word from Piney Woods? 
please advise 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York. NY 10022 

On Mar 1, 2019, at 6:05 PM, Ann Rodriquez <IMIMMIII > wrote: 

Yes, I sent an email and I spoke to Ms. Gaylord. 
Ms. Gaylord is awaiting the directors approval. 

During Bossman's last visit. 
He asked me to have Piney Woods reimburse the check in my name. So I sent a second email but no answer as yet. I 
will follow up with Piney Woods again on Monday 

I can sign the check over to whomever if a refund is issued. 

Ann R. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Mar 1, 2019, at 5:50 PM, Richard Kahn 

looks good 
thank you 

regarding piney woods are we able to get back 3,256 paid.. 
can you please inquire if you have not done so already 
thanks 

<Sierra Poleon Enrollment & Tuition Agreement 2018-2019.docx> 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

wrote: 
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On Feb 26, 2019, at 10:25 AM, ann rodriquez wrote: 

Hi all, 

attached are Anna's AMEX & VISA receipts. 
Anna owes LSJ Visa card $21.70 in Petty Cash. 
I will give Daphne the $21.70 this afternoon or I can send over to Stephanie in an envelope. 

Please advise, 
Ann R. 

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and protected 
from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any 
dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have 
received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies. 
<Visa Statement Jan-Feb.pdP'<Wendy's $21.70.pdf><Giant Gas $50.00.pdf><Total Petro $80.00.pdf><Westem 
Union $221.99.pdf><Eddy's 1-22-19 $80.00.pdt><Eddy's 1-16-19 $80.OO.pdf><Amazon $23.79 Piney Woods.pdf> 
<Amazon $48.26 Piney Woods.pdf><AMEX Statement Jan-Feb.pdf><At&t $18.70 LSJ Sim Card.pdf><At&t 
$100.00.pdf><Delta Baggage $70.00 Piney Woods.pdf><Delta Baggage $220.00 Piney Woods.pdf><Delta Baggage 
$30.00 Piney Woods.pdf><Food Center $39.96.pdf><Food Center $43.71.pdf><Food Center $88.94.pdf><Food 
Center $136.96.pdf><Hertz $203.50 Piney Woods.pdf><Home Depot $223.80.pdf><Tire Kingdom $1,199.97 LSJ 
F450.pdf><United $30.00 Piney Woods.pdf><Walgreens $38.24 Piney Woods.pdf><Walmart $67.41 Piney 
Woods.pdf><Walmart $71.69 Piney Woods.pdf><Orbitz $50.00 Piney Woods.pdf> 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
retum e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(Wamail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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