From: | <jeevacation(@gmail.com>
To: Richard Kahn _}
Subject: Re:
Date: Thu, 21 Mar 2019 14:28:10 +0000

Call me on cell

On Thu, Mar 21, 2019 at 3:03 PM Richard Kahn <} RN - ot

[ spoke with Stewart this morning he said he will not be able to provide this information to the banker. He did
offer alternatives such as redacting haze parents sfl or ste brokerage statements which would show
significantly more assets. Please advise. Thank you.

Richard Kahn

HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

On Mar 21, 2019, at 4:29 AM, ] <jeevacation( gmail.com™> wrote:

tell stewart wed appreciate him saying nothing more that the owner of haze trust has had more than 50
million dollars with us.  no more no less no names or details.  as 1 dont know this lgt banker but yes you
had the name right.
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