From: | <jeevacation(@gmail.com>

To: Stephanie Remington ||| GG

Subject: Re: Dulce
Date: Tue, 19 Mar 2019 19:19:11 +0000

Send 6k

On Tue, Mar 19, 2019 at 8:16 PM Stephanie Remington —* wrote:

Good day, Sir,

We released Dulce a few weeks ago. She received the 55K less taxes plus payment for the vacation and sick
days she had accrued. Per your suggestion she was instructed to send more information about her knee surgery
once she had 1t.

The documents are attached. Depending on the exchange rate, the total cost of a single knee replacement in the
Dominican Republic is projected to be between $5,500 - 56,000.

Please advise 1f you would like to assist Dulce with any further funds, and if so, the amount.

Thank you,
Stephanie Remington

LSIJE, LLC

On Mon, 4 Mar 2019 at 10:55, ] <jeevacation(@/gmail.com> wrote:
what do you suggest? i think send her , give her 5k , and tell her to call you when she knows what she
needs.  but release her. we can always rehire her if and when she 1s well thoughts?

On Mon, Mar 4, 2019 at 9:13 AM Stephanie Remington _ wrote:

Good morning, Sir,
Dulee has an appointment in the DR for Thursday (03/07).

Option A

[ will ask Daphne to book her flight and will request the $1500 you said to send with Dulce. Dulce has
asked that we not yet book her return flight as she may need to stay for other appointments such as an
MRI or x-rays. | advised she take her medical records with her. With this route, I'm not certain how long
she'll be gone or if she'll be back before surgery.

Option B

We will still book her flight. If you already have a predetermined amount in mind, re: severance, | can
release her tomorrow. This way she can clean out her locker, will be off payroll, will have her severance,
and will have no need to rush back. If this is your preference, please reply with the amount so we can get
that prepared. Otherwise, I'll go with Option A.

Stephanie Remington
LSJE. LLC
340-514-4446

On Thu, 28 Feb 2019 at 09:54, ] <jeevacation(@gmail.com> wrote:
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callme 212 772 9416

On Thu, Feb 28, 2019 at 8:35 AM Stephanie Remington <] GG - ot

She would prefer to go to DR than PR because she will need help after surgery and her family 1s
there.

In order to get an estimate of cost elsewhere, the doctor requires an opportunity to evaluate her.

She believes she can get it done in the DR for half of what it will cost here, but we cannot know for
sure without the evaluation of the doctor there.

Shall I schedule her an appt w Doctor in DR?

On Thu, Feb 28, 2019 at 9:14 AM J <jeevacation( gmail.com= wrote:
what about surgery in the DR or puerto rico. 7 and yes we should be very fair and caring.

On Thu, Feb 28, 2019 at 8:02 AM Stephanie Remington <] GG - o c:

Good morning, Sir,

Dulee called two nights ago begging me to call her doctor to get her more pain medicine. |
believe she 15 in pain. | also fear she 15 becoming dependent on the pain medication her doctors
keep feeding her.

Although Dulee 1s the most valuable among the housekeeping staff to us, these issues are
beginning to weigh against her contribution. [ believe it may be best for us and for Dulce to retire
her. We will definitely feel her absence. Since she has been with you for 18 years, so [ suspect
yvou would have input on how we go about this.

According to the information | already sent you and Rich, the cost of a single knee surgery in
Florida, including 6 weeks of rehabilitation here, would be about $40K.. This is too much. Would
you consider retiring her with 25-50% of that amount? This would be advantageous in the
following ways:

* Her release would move us one step closer to making your desired transitions in
housekeeping.

* We would be absolved from considering any future medical expenses or loss of time from
work for Dulce.

+ She would depart on good terms.

» She will have the resources to go back to the DR where her family/support system is so she
can get the surgery and medical care that she needs.

Thank you,

Stephanie Remington
LSJE,LLC
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JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof 1s strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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