
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Heather Gray < >, Richard Kahn < 

Subject: Re: Braque 

Date: Wed, 30 Aug 2017 14:54:13 +0000 

Neither you nor your lawyers represent us!! 

On Wed, Aug 30, 2017 at 10:49 AM jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
You should not be giving anything to auditors re us 
This is wrong from get go 

On Wed, Aug 30, 2017 at 10:40 AM Heather Gray < wrote: 

Hi Rich, 

We need to get back to the auditors, so I just want to confirm that no sales tax has been paid on the Braque. 
That was my sense from our conversation last week, but I want to be certain before I speak with the 
lawyers. I'm in the office if you'd like to discuss this. 

Best, 

Heather 

Heather Gray 

Art Counsel 
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