
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gtnail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Nautica 
Date: Tue, 22 Aug 2017 18:52:38 +0000 

ok 

On Tue, Aug 22, 2017 at 2:44 PM, Richard Kahn
it appears attached is an estimate not a firm quote 
did carlos receive exact specifications from you so that their is no confusion 
please advise if ok to proceed 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Carlos Rodriguez  
Subject: Fw: Little C 
Date: August 22, 2017 at 1:12:57 PM EDT 
To: "Jeffre E." <'eevacation mail.com> Ann Rodriquez , Richard 
Kahn Da•hne Wallace 
Reply-To: Carlos Rodriguez 

> wrote: 

Greetings all, this is the estimate for the modifications on Nautica boat. Installation of chocks and fabrication of a lid for 
anchor locker that is not covered. 
Thanyou 
Carlos 

On Tuesday, August 22, 2017 9:48 AM, picasso 

Dear Carlos. 

Please find attached estimate. 

Thank you and Regards 
Narinee Seonarain 

`c > wrote: 
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B.V.I. Painters Ltd Marine Refinishers 

URL: www.bvipainters.com 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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