
From: Richard Kahn
To: Neale Attenborough 
Cc: Chris Lawler <a> 

Subject: Next 
Date: Tue, 22 Aug 2017 19:30:14 +0000 

nice talking with you both earlier 
did claxon receive 609k from milan in 2009? if not sure who should I direct that question to? 
also please send balance sheet and cash flow information 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

> On Aug 22, 2017, at 1:00 PM, Richard Kahn a wrote: 

> <K1 2008 Claxon.pdfxKl 2009 Claxon.pdf,<K1 2010 Claxon.pdf><K1 2011 Claxon.pdf><K1 2012 
Claxon.pdf><K1 2013 Claxon.pdfxKl 2014 Claxon.pdf> 

> Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 
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