From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>

To: Richard Kahn <||
Subject: Re:
Date: Mon, 21 Aug 2017 17:20:47 +0000

[8/12/17, 6:19:30 PM] Cgera: PayPal?
[8/12/17, 6:19:44 PM] Crera: _ can we e do pay pal .

On Mon, Aug 21, 2017 at 1:14 PM, Richard Kahn ﬂ_’ wrote:

we have not yet wired to svet

Eichard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel

cell

On Aug 21, 2017, at 12:42 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacationfagmail.com™> wrote:

dollars ok. we wired some to her before right?

On Mon, Aug 21, 2017 at 12:41 PM, Richard Kahn <} R - ot

sveta bank account (russian) 15 in us dollors - should we convert 5k euro to dollars or 15 USD ok at 5k
dylan - kogan? not sure which charity you would like us to sent to? enhanced 7 gratitude 7

please advise
thank vou

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

tel
fax
cell
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On Aug 21, 2017, at 12:36 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail. com™ wrote:

B 5 cuo and dylan charity 25 [§? dollars.?
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