From: David Mitchell <]
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Re:
Date: Mon, 22 Jan 2018 21:32:10 +0000

Update

Mot sure Steve understands the situation even though |, I have tried to explain it
Howie asks to my lawyer are

A note to Steve Hanson for $222,000,

A retroactive legal engagement for Howile going back to inception

A note for $87.500 for Russell Rosenberg who they think will put up the money , but they have not asked him
vet

Detailed back up for all the money I have advanced ., so they can review it
(T have no 1ssue with this , but all this takes time )

...................................
-----------------------------------

Mitchell Holdings LLC
745 Fifth Avenue
Mew York NY 10151

On Jan 22, 2018, at 2:45 PM, David Mitchell </} | I - ' rote:

Says that Howie 1s trying to raise his portion

i)A'&"I[} MITCHELL

Mitchell Holdings LLC
745 Fifth Avenue
MNew York NY 10151

LUSA

On Jan 22, 2018, at 2:32 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com> wrote:

7T ?what happened?
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On Mon, Jan 22, 2018 at 4:23 PM, David Mitchell <} R - ot

FYI;
sent this to Hanson this morning, he will need to fund soon

Payments made as of date of Crescendo term sheet:

5 5,000.00 - Check #1499 to Sadkin (Legal retainage per term sheet)
S 1,177.70 - ATM Ending 8006 on 01.17.18 to ConEd

540,000.00 - Wire on 01.22.18 to Life Hotel Operations

£ 6,400.00 - Wire on 01.18.18 to Life Hotel Operations (net)
§52,577.70

DIM Reimbursable as of 12/31/17:
51,112,522.11

...................................

Mitchell Holdings LLC
745 Fifth Avenue
Mew York NY 10151

USA

please note
The information contained in this communication 15
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 15 the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof 1s strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation/w gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all nights reserved
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