From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>

o

Subject: Re: Visa/ check
Date: Mon, 14 Aug 2017 13:28:30 +0000

resubmit, with premium preessing  asap

On Mon, Aug 14, 2017 at 7:27 AM, Svetlana P. f_ wrote:

Hi Arda,

My check hasn't been cashed yet as of this morning. Will yvou please let us know? Thank vou!
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