
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: mila 
Date: Mon, 24 Jul 2017 14:38:57 +0000 

10k 

On Mon, Jul 24, 2017 at 10:38 AM, Richard Kahn 
pelase advise on amount to send 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 

On Jul 24, 2017, at 8:51 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

Jul 22 (2 days ago) 
to me 

I'm currently staying at 

My bank information is: 

MMI 
Thank you, 

please note 

wrote: 
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including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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