
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: 

Subject: Re: Invoices/Kevin Ouvre 
Date: Mon, 24 Jul 2017 19:12:38 +0000 

Inline-Images: Capture_d'ecran_2016-03-11X15.51.11.png 

not sure , the fine for the trees was HUGE 

On Mon, Jul 24, 2017 at 1:42 PM, 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Kevin Ouvre 
Date: July 24, 2017 at 12:51:58 PM EDT 
To: 
Subject: Invoices 

> wrote: 

One last thing sorry, 

Regarding my invoices do you know whether they would be treated for this end month? 

Best regards, 

Kevin. 

SAS KO CONCEPT 
Anse des Cayes. 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
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JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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