
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: 

Subject: Re: ASAP April statement 
Date: Tue, 25 Jul 2017 02:26:41 +0000 

tried to call , yes I will fly in, and i can meet with accounting after 4 pm. if that is ok, with you. 

On Mon, Jul 24, 2017 at 9:28 PM, 
I hope it 11 be the last one that disturb you. 
the Answer from the booker. 

Hattano nepeaopecoommoro coo6uxemet: 

arnpaemTenb: Gianmaria Cassani 
TeMa: Omer: ASAP April statement 
gam: 24 kuonR 2017 r., 9:16:11 PM GMT-4 
non marenb: 

Konma: Evelina Fernandez 

wrote: 

, Christian Paris 

, Alex 

Accounting will be happy to clarify with you tomorrow client by client 

Bottom line , will u fly in for your jobs confirmed ? There will be no problem to advance for you flight ticket 
and accommodation if needed 

Please let me know asap and I will push accounting to investigate properly about late payments 

Best, 
GIANMARIA C. 
Director of Women's Division & 
International Management 
Ma'or Model NYC 

www.majormodel.com 

Follow us: 
Women's Blog I Men's Blog 
Twitter I Tumblr I Facebook 
www.majormodeltv.com 

BOOKING CONDITIONS: 
+ CANCELLATION POLICY: On confirmed bookings: Within three working days, full fee. Within five 
working days, half fee. 
+ OVERTIME RATES: Time-and-a-half apply after 8 hours in-studio up to 10 hours, and 10 hours on 
location up to 12 hours. 
Double time after 10 hours in-studio and 12 hours on location. On Saturdays, Sundays and Holidays day rate 
based on an 8 hour day. 
+ LINGERIE AND MEN'S UNDERWEAR RATES: Applies for Bras, Panties, Briefs, Boxers, Slips, 
Pantyhose, Sleepwear, Transparent 
or Translucent articles. Agency must check with model before accepting any lingerie bookings. 
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+ WEATHER PERMIT: On Confirmed Bookings: All same day cancellations — Half fee if services are 
immediately rescheduled; Full fee 
if services not rescheduled. Weather permit cancellations made earlier are subject to normal cancellation 
policy. 
+ WEATHER PERMIT OPTIONS: Book or release will be enforced for options when secondary job is ready 
to confirm. 
+ USE RIGHTS: Are limited to the specific rights granted and may not be extended without negotiations. 

From: 
Sent: Monday, July 24, 2017 9:12:57 PM 
To: Gianmaria Cassani; Christian Paris 
Cc: Evelina Fernandez; Alex 
Subject: Fwd: ASAP April statement 

I have always been very respectful , and patient. I think there might be a misunderstanding. 
My statement (the last that Got from accounting dept) shows 12, 400 dollars owed to me. ( file attached) 
I got money from 
Galia Lahav (4.22.2017)1000$ 
Galia Lahav (4.23.2017)1300$ 
Lela Rose (4.20.2017)750$ and 400 from wire in June. 
But I also did 
Natori (5.1.2017)800$ 
Pratt fitting (5.1.2017) 150 $ 
Natori (5.2.2017) 800$ 
Natori (5.3.2017)800$ 
Pratt show (5.4.2017)1200$ 
Veronica beard ( 5.31.2017) 500$+20% 

I know of no balance owing to you. As you can see from the attached statments some of these jobs are from 
last year, and most over 3 months ago. Could you please investigate. 

I view you and your agency as professionals as I view myself. To be clear, is the accounting dept telling you 
and I that none of the clients on the attached list has paid yet. ? 
Thank you for your attention and kindness. Can you clarify for me , who owes what to whom. ? 

I am surprised that you suggest the word blackmail when I am asking for money that i have worked for. 
Do we know when the clients will pay.? 

Hagan° nepeaApecosammoro coofteavut: 

Ornpamtreak: Evelina Fernandez c 
TeMa: Omer: ASAP April statement 
L(ara: 9 man 2017 r., 4:00:22 PM GMT-4 
Boa vana b: 

Dear M, 

Attached is your Open Balance. 

Regards, 

Gianmaria Cassani 
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Evelina 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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