From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=>

To: Richard Kahn < -
Subject: Re:
Date: Sat, 22 Jul 2017 19:27:36 +0000

we owe them 20k, for the balance of the 3 months. 1 would pay it over 4 months. 1f they want to be done.

On Sat, Jul 22, 2017 at 3:25 PM, Richard Kahn <|| - o<

Calling Michael now. s 5k per month for both of them or each.

Richard Kahn

HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Phone

Fax 64

Cell 91

On Jul 22, 2017, at 1:45 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@ gmail.com= wrote:

[ want them off the island by monday at 12, with their things.  we will continue to keep kimberly for at
least 3 mnths . at 75k annual. . otherwise will will pay them 5k a mnth for the end of the next 4 months.
and they are on their own.

you can tell them that 1 spent more time with them then all other housekeepers.
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