
From: Richard Kahn
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: CONFIDENTIAL 
Date: Thu, 13 Jul 2017 02:47:43 +0000 

FYI 
i will send 15k tomorrow unless you tell me otherwise 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022
tel 
fax 
cc 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Martin G. Weinberg" c 
Subject: Re: CONFIDENTIAL 
Date: July 12, 2017 at 10:34:11 PM EDT 
To: "Richard Kahn" gc l> 

Thank you. But if its easier to wait until friday, monday that's fine too. Marty 

From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Wednesday, July 12, 2017 6:28 PM 
To: Martin G. Weinberg 
Subject: Re: CONFIDENTIAL 

i have not been able to connect with jee for his approval on outstanding balance however i will send 15k tomorrow am 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York. NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 
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On Jul 12, 2017, at 11:07 AM, Martin G. Weinberg c...=S wrote: 

Richard, if you can make a payment this week on the April and May legal work that was invoiced in early May and June 
it would be appreciated. Thanks, Marty 
Martin G Weinberg PC 
20 Park Plaza 
Suite 1000 
Boston, MA 02116 
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