From: Richard Kahn _}
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Fwd: L8] MC Kitchen Oven
Date: Tue, 05 Jun 2018 15:21:59 +0000
Attachments: LS] MC Kitchen Viking Oven.pdf

please confirm you would like new oven for LSJ kitchen and that Viking 1s ok

https:Mwww us-appliance . com/ver7486ess html?

relid=CjwKCAjw6d)Y BRBEEiwAoAF60WZEGEVEILIWORbEkwlyT72loYaibs57JzUced VT 3iujh TYuSoEY TWho

CEF9EQAvD BwE

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: brice gordon _}
Subject: LSJ MC Kitchen Oven

Date: June 5, 2018 at 12:18:29 AM EDT

To: Rich Kahn < =
Cc:LSJGSJ < >

Rich
attached

Price check for a new Viking Oven, Main Kitchen L5J-512.699.00 - { Daphne)
Al Madison - $12699.00

Appliance Connection - 12699.00

LS Appliance, 1269900

Marcelin Home Appliances, $15500.00 free shipping, plus free dishwasher !

The existing oven has the following issues, both ovens do not work,
As you are aware this has been an on going issue.

how do vou wish to proceed

EFTA01040982



regards

Brice Gordon
The Saint James Group
USVI

EFTA01040983



