From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
To: [N -
Subject: Re:
Date: Fri, 07 Jul 2017 22:40:27 +0000

hitp://www. bbe.com/mews/health-40520125

On Sat, Jul 8, 2017 at 12:27 AM. || | - - -

Thank you , Jeffrey !
On Fri, 7 Jul 2017 at 16:59, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com> wrote:
of course

On Fri, Jul 7, 2017 at 9:31 PM, | - - -

Jeffrey,
can [ ask Bella to pay for my apartments in -‘? [ cannot make a payment with my card ,
unfortunately.
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