
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

To: "Barry J. Cohen"

Subject: Re: [External] Re: Plane 

Date: Tue, 27 Jun 2017 23:22:13 +0000 

im on if you prefer to chat 

On Tue, Jun 27, 2017 at 7:19 PM, Bany J. Cohen < > wrote: 

We want new and better terms, and they want to change a few things. One complication is that BofA gave us the worst 
terms of any of the banks that responded. 

From: Jeffrey E. Imailto:jeeyacationagmail.com 
Sent: Tuesday, June 27, 2017 7:18 PM 
To: Barry J. Cohen 
Subject: [External] Re: Plane 

no worry , usaully less than a week . just go to jape and ask for the gulfstream line to be upped 

On Tue, Jun 27, 2017 at 7:13 PM, Barry J. Cohen < > wrote: 

You are right. Banks are aggressively pursuing our business. I'm just not sure how long it takes to nail down the banks, 
write a loan agreement, etc. 

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@gmail.com 
Sent: Tuesday, June 27, 2017 7:06 PM 
To: Barry J. Cohen 
Subject: [External] 

you should be able to line up financing before purchase agreement signed. no contingenet without a serious 
non refundable deposit normally. not worth it. just get a commitment from bank? is there something im 
missing.? 
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communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the person or entity to 
whom they are addressed and may contain confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, 
dissemination or other use of, or taking of any action in reliance upon this information by persons or entities 
other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you have received this email in error please contact the 
sender and delete the material from any computer. Apollo Global Management, LLC 
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