
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Supercab F250 for LSJ 

Date: Thu, 22 Jun 2017 14:45:56 +0000 

ok 

On Thu, Jun 22, 2017 at 10:43 AM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 
best price per dealer was 50,972 which does not include tropical (2-3k) and liR gate which anna thinks we can 
do in USVI which will be another 3-4k 
they would not budge on their Internet price but i am trying for 50,000 and should know this am 
car needs 2-3 days of prep and then off to tropical so by July 7th car should be landed in ST 1' 
then we will need to register 

anna says this car is to be used solely on STT for airport luggage and tropical runs and not to go on barge to 
preserve its life.. 

httplAvww.mullinaxfordpalmbeach.com/new/Ford/2017-Ford-F-250-e50b5e010a0e0a1771591b19917467 
Ic.htm?searchDepth=3:13 

http://www.windowsticker. forddireet.com/windowsticker.pdf?token=jPFdk0AVIgioSe4OgD% 
2F2XPQAeJQ5QezYoKs%2FD5Qrr/o2B43tOLqn5WUr7wze4uVadclKvHhC9 
13IV%2BbGdrRLqcB%2FiHkXtQtc0/02FvpROpWUhyXRoUQPwhtyG2GXcQnN2 
kMUveyXp%2FdcCKHS6CYlrYakRj%2BMEIOtsVUnsEK9OzqR6%2BNBk%3D 

please advise if Ford-250 for LSJ is ok to proceed 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Kyle Brown" < 
Subject: FW: Supercab F250 
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Date: June 21, 2017 at 4:48:22 PM EDT 
To: 
Reply-To: "Kyle Brown" < 

Kyle Brown 

Internet Sales 

 Original Message 
FROM EMAIL: 
TO: 
Sent: 6/21/2017 3:27:04 PM 
SUBJECT: Supercab F250 
Attachments: Kahn Ford tinancing.pdf; Kahn Export price.pdf 

Richard, 

Here is the pricing for the truck that you requested. One is for Ford Financing if it was going to be 
registered here, and the export price which doesnt have the rebates, but also doesnt include the taxes. Give 
me a call or email me and let me know what you would like to do. 

Kyle Brown 

Internet Sales 

This email was sent to: 
From: Mullinax Ford of Palm Beach 1210 Northlake Blvd Lake Park, FL 33403 

Update Preferences to update your communication preferences. 
Urtsubscribe - to stop all future email communications (REF_V2196850-587016_NO). 
Terms and Conditions 

please note 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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