From: [N
To: jeevacation(a@gmail.com
Subject: Fwd: contract with revisions

Date: Mon, 26 Jun 2017 11:15:26 +0000

Attachments: Mount Sinai Contract Revision 2-10-17p.pdf

-—--Original Message-----

From: namyfisch <N
To: jeevacation <jeevacation@gmail.com=
Sent: Fri, Feb 10, 2017 2:18 pm

Subject: Re: contract with revisions

You are correct. | changed the contract to include your suggestion (attached). Arthur Klein offered to pay the expenses

upfront so that | can pay them and avoid Sinai getting involved. He recommended it and | like the idea.

Harry

-—-Original Message--—-

From: jeffrey E. <jeevacationi@gmail.com=
To,Hary Fisch <R

Sent: Fri, Feb 10, 2017 12:47 pm
Subject: Re: contract with revisions

why salaey increase in place of expenses that was not the offer

On Fri, Feb 10, 2017 at 12:43 PM, <} NG - - ot=:

Jeffrey

Take a look at the contract with my revisions. Let me know what you think before | send it back.

As always,
Thnaks

P3-look at how | spelled thanks. Am | dyslexic?
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