
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail cam',

To: "John P. Woods, AIA"  Daphne Walla 
Amy Dempsey , Richard Kahn 

Subject: Re: GSJ Invoice 

Date: Tue, 20 Jun 2017 13:52:29 +0000 

I would like the permits for docks and all construction to go in to jp asap, please call him today 

On Tue, Jun 20, 2017 at 9:32 AM, John P. Woods, AIA > wrote: 
I am off island right now. I asked Daphne to send it to you as she was copied originally. 

JPW 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jun 20, 2017, at 9:11 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

nothing attached 

On Tue, Jun 20, 2017 at 9:11 AM, John P. Woods, AIA < > wrote: 
Ok 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jun 20, 2017, at 8:37 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

i did not , can you resend to me. 

On Tue, Jun 20, 2017 at 8:34 AM, John P. Woods, AIA < wrote: 
Good morning Jeffrey, 

Have you had time to review our invoice for GSJ that was sent a couple of weeks ago? Also, did you 
review the evaluation report for the LSJ shop buildings or the elevations for the LSJ pavilion? 

JPW 

Sent from my iPhone 
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