From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationfwgmail.com>
To: Richard Kahn *—-“-*
Subject: Re: Bentley
Date: Fri, 26 May 2017 17:02:02 +0000

Ok

On Fri, May 26, 2017 at 12:27 PM Richard Kahn *:_'-'-* wrote:
attached is final invoice totaling 278,120.24 which included 10,000 discount negotiated, 50,000 deposit and
135,000 mercedes trade
everything looks good and the onnly 1ssue 1 am waiting on an explanation 1s personalized plagque on sticker for
2555 which we were never told about
please advise if ok to wire funds for balance with 2555 holdback

additionally what time would you like to receive car on tuesday and at 9 east 71st or at showroom
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: Gary Price </ -

Subject: Re: Menu

Date: May 23, 2017 at 4:04:35 PM EDT

To: Richard Kahn < >

Cc: Danielle Weinstein < =

Here you go...

Gary Price * Director of Finance =+

Email |

Manhattan Motorcars * Porsche of Princeton *Porsche of Huntington » Classic Auodi
711 Eleventh Ave. New York, NY 10019
hetp/Swww. manhattanmotorcars.com
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Gary Price * Director of Finance =+

Email |

Manhattan Motorcars * Porsche of Princeton *Porsche of Huntington » Classic Auodi
711 Eleventh Ave. New York, NY 10019
hitpwww. manhattanmotorcars. com

| Facebook | Twitter | Vioogle Plus

_'L‘n'uulul*:_'LJ.il'.L-.xI.n

Lt

On Tue, May 23, 2017 at 3:58 PM, Richard Kahn *—'-* wrote:
1 will need a detailed invoice in order to make payment
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

On May 23, 2017, at 3:58 PM, Gary Price <_-} wrote:

Ok...The balance due i1s $278,120.24. Wire instructions attached...

Thanks,

Garv Price * Director of Finance *

Email |

Manhattan Motorcars » Porsche of Princeton *Porsche of Huntington » Classic Aundi
711 Eleventh Ave. New York, NY 10019
http/www. manhattanmaotorcars.com
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Gary Price * Director of Finance *

Email |

Manhattan Motorcars * Porsche of Princeton *Porsche of Huntington » Classic Audi
711 Eleventh Ave. New York, NY 10019
MI": wiw.manhattanmotorcars.com
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On Tue, May 23, 2017 at 3:53 PM, Richard Kahn <[} R - - ot::

we will not be transferring plates and will need new plates
will send back signed authorization shortly
thank vou

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
MNew York, NY 10022

On May 23, 2017, at 3:30 PM, Gary Price <[ | [ N - -

Great! We will get going on everything now. Please sign and return the attached authorization to do
the work. Are we transferring plates from the Maybach? If so 1 will need a copy of the registration
which will also be good for the proof of Corp we need. Let me know and [ will send you the balance
due amount and wire transfer instructions...

Thanks,

Gary Price * Director of Finance =

Email |

Manhattan Motorcars * Porsche of Princeton *Porsche of Huntington = Classic Audi
711 Eleventh Ave. New York, NY 10019
http:/fwww manhattanmotorcars.com
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Garv Price * Director of Finance =

Email |

Manhattan Motorcars * Porsche of Princeton *Porsche of Huntington = Classic Audi
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On Tue, May 23, 2017 at 2:37 PM, Richard Kahn &_" wrote:

thank vou
ves we will also go with Ceramic Pro for 3850

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

On May 23, 2017, at 2:05 PM, Gary Price %_‘-* wrote:

No problem.. Please ask him if he would consider the Ceramic Pro if [ could do it for $3850. 1
believe that he will truly be impressed by the finish with the protection on the car.

Gary Price * Director of Finance *

Email [

Manhattan Motorcars * Porsche of Princeton *Porsche of Huntington « Classic Audi
711 Eleventh Ave. New York, NY 10019
hitp/www.manhattanmotorcars. com
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Gary Price * Director of Finance *

Email [

Manhattan Motorcars * Porsche of Princeton *Porsche of Huntington « Classic Audi
711 Eleventh Ave. New York, NY 10019
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On Tue, May 23, 2017 at 1:29 PM, Richard Kahn *'»'—'* wrote:

thanks for sending
we are going to go with the Ding and Dent Package only

Richard Kahn
HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor

Mew York, NY 10022
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On May 23, 2017, at 11:20 AM, Gary Price *’_‘-* wrote:

Here you go...

Gary Price * Director of Finance -+

Email [

Manhattan Motorcars * Porsche of Princeton *Porsche of Huntington » Classic Audi

711 Eleventh Ave. Mew York, MY 10019
Ittpewww manhattanmotorcars. com
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<NES Menu.pdf=

=<NES Final.pdf=

<Manhattan Motorcars Wire Instructions, pdf=

please note
The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof 1s strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationf@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all nghts reserved
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