From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationigmail com=
o vier -
Subject: Fwd: BBJ SN 20884 [CC-MEROFID500434)
Drate: Twe, 16 May 2007 2Z2:32:12 +(HIH)

Send only lady email to bob

e Forwarded message ——-——-

From: Larry - =

Date: Wed, May 17, 2007 at 12:26 AM

Subject: Fad: BB SN 30884 [CC-MERCLFID1500434]

To: Je vacation <jgevacationfcgmaill.com>=, Darren Indvke _'}
This email trail has some high points from past discussions with Clar and Husham

Darren Indvke

Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 12, 2016, at #:20 AM, Claire Brugirard < ||| |G- o

Dear Darren,

Owir leadership has instructed me to send you our final offer as follows;

l. The purchase price to remain at 17.5 M

2. The high time engine will be replaced with the original engine

3. The two additional aux fuel tanks which were recently located will be included in the loose equipment list

4. The pre-buy inspection and the delivery to be at Abu Dhabi International (Etthad Engineering) which is an MREO approved by both GCAA and
FAA, or within UAE as long as it is an FAA/GCAA approved facility audited by Royal Jet.

5. Roval Jet will be responsible for any discrepancies with the agreed cap of 500,000 above which Royal Jet can either elect to pay for the
discrepancies or to refund the pre-buy inspection costs

. Please note that Roval Jet will only address airworthy items and any cosmetic items shall not be considered as a discrepancy; as such there will

be ne touch up work on the interior wood work done, and the condition of the woodwork should not be a reason for rejecting the aircraft

We do agree to include in the delivery condition that there shall be issued by the GCAA | in form and in substance satisfactory to the FAA, as determined by a
duly authorized designated airworthiness representative of the FAA selected by Purchaser in its discretion, an export certificate of airworthiness.

With regards to your request about items and matters that require correction in order for the aireraft to be qualified for issuance of a U.S. Certificate of
Adrworthiness; we fully realize that the intention is to register the aircraft in the USA, however, we would appreciate your understanding that we cannot
expose ourselves by committing to fulfilling requirements that are unknown to us. Therefore, and since the DAR would in any case be involved with the
issuance of the export certificate, we request that this item remains deleted as suggested in the last draft purchase agreement which was sent through {unless
there would be a way to know beforehand what such requirements would entail).

This offer 1s of course subject to agreeing and signing a binding purchase agreement between the parties and if the buyer is willing to proceed, then we would

request that the text of such purchase agreement is agreed upon no later than Thursday, 27" October, 2016 i preferably before), and for the pre-buy inspection
to start as soon as possible thereafter.

We look forward to hearing from you soon.
Best Regards
<image(0 1 png=

Claire Brugirard
Sales Manager

Sent from my 1Pad

Begin forwarded message:

From: Manny Castanedo *-_
Date: October 17, 2016 at 4:49:47 PM GMT+2
To: Lyjet <[ -

Ce: mannyai fiurbinepower net, ||
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Subject: He: BRI 5N 30884 [CC-MEROUFIDTS00434]

Larry:
Thanks, will review and advise.

Repards,

Om Ot 17, 2006, at 1030, Lvjet <] NG o

Manny and Freddy

gttached ks engine data for your evaluaton..

#2 engine is original serial number B39151 Ia installed on #2 position. has estimate 6200 hours total time. Mo shop visit,
#1 engine currently Installed ig garal 878170 installed on #1 position. has 12,400 hours total time, has been to shog.

[we could install eanginal engene serial number 355146 in #1 position to replace B76170} a0 that engine mes are more closaty match, not exact. rather than having & 6000 hour engene, and & 12,000 hour engine
Imatalad.

the ongenal engee installed In &1 posibon senal & 556146 was removed due 1o metal in ol samgle from Gear box. and repasred.,

we have the option to install this original engine back on the BBJ,. Seller Informs the margin on this engine is +35 degrees at Take-off EFR. the engine currently installed has been 1o shop, with +40 degree margin
eoconding to Seller, with a +49 degree mange in test call,,, but has 12,400 hours since new. does It make sense 1o Install orginal engme, or (8 the performace so much greater on the 12,400 hour serlal 876170 that
wi should keep this engine installed?

need your sdvise pleaga?

thank you,
Larry

----- Original Message---—-

From: Husham Osman
To: Larry
Ce: Claire Brugirard ; Darren Indyke <= Netson. Michae! < -

Sent: Mon, Oct 17, 2016 %10 am
Subject BEJ SH 30884 [CC-MERO.FID1500434]

Dear Larry

Please see attached my answers to the below points aleng with valid attachments. This should suffice the engineering consultant. If wou have any guestions please do not hesitate to let us know.
Best regards

Best Regards,

<imageddl.png> <image002_gif>Husham Osman
Dwrector Technscal

_ Abu Dhabi, United Arab Emirates
4 |

From: Larry |mailto )

Sent: Friday, October 14, 2016 8:34 PM

To: Claire Brugirard; Husham Osman

Ce: Darren Indyke; Nelson, Michael; Rob DiCastr
Sluhiect: Re: BBJ SN 30884 |C{.'-MI:HU.FID15LKJ=‘I-3-I1]

Greetings Husham,
All ks going well,.

Can you provide the following info on the original engine we are conternplating to install?
1-mimipack of LSV for Review on engines
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Mini-pack LSV attached for ESN 888148

2-Request ECM

Latest ECM report of ESN 888148 [original engine] and existing engines (876170 & 889151) s attached.
3-was the engine test call run after its Gear box repar?

If a0, 11l need test cadl results. please.

Yes, see summary performance attached

4- you mention 35 degres margin at. What power setting?
EGT hot day Margin is given at TAKE OFF

5-Any and all info that | can fwd to my engine personnel for evaluation.
Modification Record of the original engine also attached for your review

&- can you refresh my memory on Margin and test cell report of the 12,400 how engine currently nstalied on DFR.?
Pleass include tast cell results an the 12,400 hour engine as well for our comparison.
Test Cell Margin was 490eg C. See attached 876170 Test Data. Current EGTM at takeoff Is ~ 40deg C

Best,
Larry

Sent from my iPad
On Oct 14, 2016, at 12:12 PM, Claire Brugirard <TG - ot

Dear Darren,
Diear Larry

Your message well received, | am glad we could come to an agreement and that we can proceed with the contract

Please let us know exactly what infarmation is required regarding the engines and the tanks so that we can ask aur technical team to prepare this
| Sugpeit Milos to arnend the latect draft AP with the agreed conditions and to send it throwgh to you for review on Sunday or Manday.

Best Regards,

Claire Brugirard

§ |

From: Darren Indyke

Sent: Friday, October 14, 2016 19:46

To: Claire Brugirard

Ce: Rob DiCastri; Nelson, Michael; Larry

Subject: Re: BED SN 30884 [CC-MERD . FID1500434]

Dear Claire:

Let's proceed with the purchase agreement. We will need more detads concerning the engine, but this should not hold us up. Can you please provide us with the details for the two exira tanks so that we
may include descriptive nformaton (Le., serial numbers, etc.) in the purchase agreement. Thank you.

Best,

DARREM K- INDYKE
DARREM K- INDYKE. PLLC

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attomey-clent
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthonzed use, disclosure or copying of this communication
or any part thereof is stictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us iImmediately by retumn e-mail, and destroy this
communication and all coples thereof, incheding all attachments.

Copynght of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - & 2016 Damen K.

Indyke, PLLC — All ights reserved.

On Oct 13, 2016, at 1:35 PM. Claire Brugirard <G - -

Dear Dasren, Lamy
| am resending below message without the document attached sinoe | got an undeliverable message and am not sure if you gat this.
Best Regards,

Claire Brugirand

N

From: Caire Brugirard

Sent: Thursday, October 13, 2016 15:28

To: Darren Indyke

Ccx Rob DiCastri; Melson, Michael; Larmy

Subject: RE: BB 5M 30884 [CC-MERO.FID1500434]

Dear Darran,
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| am copying kelow the information recelved from our Director Technical which was also sent to Larry today;
The original engine of AGDFRS1 - ESN 888148 (ABRIY/1 Ex-ABDFR) had a defect rectification shop visit @ 4, 4%9hrs/1,669cyc In Now 2013, See attached 5V document
o AGETGEE - Overhauled
a All other modules are not accessed
@ Current EGT Margin = 35degC. The margin is good enough to go another S+years based on RO fleet experience and current utilization rate.
a Current Time/Cycle = 5,951hrs/2, 18T oyc
wie will have to ground twa alrcraft to perform the double engine swap which requires a kot or preparation, therafore we would request to do the engine change during the pre-buy here in Abu Dhabi.
If your principal is ready to proceed with this offer then we would start planning this accordingly.

Given this additional effort we are hopeful that we can now come to an agreement together and we look forward to receiving your response.

Best Regards
<imageldl.png=>
Claire Brugirard

Sales Manager

| Abu Dhabd, United Arab Emi

From: Darren Indyke [mailto:

Sent: Wednesday, October 12, 2016 11:06 P

To: Claire Brugirard

Ce: Fob DiCastri; Nelson, Michael; Larry

Subject: fe: BBJ SN 30884 [CC-MERD.FID1500434]

Claire:

Thank you for your emall. Would you please send me the current specs for the original engine that will replace the high tme engine.
Regards,

Damen Indyke

Sent from my iPhone

On Ot 12, 2018, st 5:20 AM. Cleire Brugirard <Gz - -

Dear Darren,

Our leadership has instructed me to send you our final affer as follows;

1. The purchase price to remain at 17.5 M

2. The high time engine will ke replaced with the original engine

3. The two additional aux fuel tanks which were recently located will be included in the loose eguipment list

4. The pre-buy inspection and the delivery to be at Abu Dhabi International (Etihad Engineering) which ks an MRO approved by both GCAA and FAA, or within UAE as long as it Is an FAASGCAR

approved facllity audited by Royal let.

5. Royal let will be responsible for amy discrepancies with the agreed cap of 500,000 above which Royal let can either elect to pay for the discrepancies or to refund the pre-buy Inspection
costs

6. Please note that Royal Jet will only address alrworthy items and any cosmetic iterns shall not be conskdered as a discrepancy; as such there will be no towch up work on the interior wood
work done, and the condition of the woodwork should not be a reason for rejecting the alrcraft

We do agree to include in the delivery condition that there shall be ssued by the GCAA, in form and in substance satisfactony to the FAA, as determined by a duly authorized designated alrworthiness
representative of the FAA selected by Purchaser In its discretion, an export certificate of alrworthiness.

With regards to your reguest about items and matters that require correction in erder for the aircraft to be gualified for ssuance of a US. Certificate of Alrwarthiness; we fully realize that the intention is
to reglster the alroraft in the USA, however, we would appreciate your understanding that we cannot expose ourselves by committing to fulfilling reguirements that are unknown to us. Therefore, and
since the DAR would in any case be Involved with the Issuance of the export certificate, we request that this item remains deleted as suggested in the last draft purchase agreement which was sent
thraugh [unless there would be a way to know beforehand what such reguirements would entall).

This offer is of course subject to agreeing and signing a binding purchase agreernent between the parties and If the buyer is willing to proceed, then we would request that the text of such purchase
agreernent is agreed upon no later than Thursday, 275" October, 2016 (preferably before), and for the pre-buy inspection to start as soon as possible thereafter.

We look forward to hearing from you soon.
Best Hegards
<imagedil.png=
Claire Brugirard

Sales Manager

I it Dhabi, United Arab Emirates
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From: Darren Indyke [mallto

Sent: Wednesday, October 12, 2016 12:19 AM

To: Claire Brugirard

Ce: Rob DiCastr; Nelson, Micheel, Larry

Subject: Re: BB SH 30884 [CC-MERO. FID1500434)

Dear Claire:

| understand that Royal Jet has made a revised offer, which Is to to replace the high time engine on the asrcraft with the original engine that was previously replaced and to include two extra fuel tanks, to
set the purchase price at $17.5 Milkon, and to have the pre-buy inspection take place at a facility in the UAE_ |3 this correct? Please advise.

Thank you.
Regards,

DARREM K INDYKE
DARREM K_ INDYKE, PLLC

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attomey-chent
privileged, and s intended only for the use of the addressea. it is the propery of

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthonzed use, disclosure or copying of this communicabon
or any part thereof |s strictly prohibited and may be unkawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by retum e-mail, and destroy this
communication and &ll coples thereof, including all attachments.

Copyright of Damen K- Indyke, PLLGC - @ 2016 Darren K.

Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved.

On Oct 10, 2016, at 1:47 PM, Darren Indyke <||KKNGG- oo

Dear Mr. DéCastn:

Inasmuch as Royal Jet has akready agreed 1o be responsible for up to $500,000 of dscrepanckss noted during the pre-purchase inspection, your emad below &= cleardy a move in the wrong direction.
However, we are prepared to offer Royal Jet, LLC §17_2 million on the same terms &s previously agreed without & reguirement that you restore the woodwork to an acceptable condition. This absolutely
requires you to address discrepancies at your cost and requires you 1o pay our inspection fees and costa should you refuse or fail to correct discrepancees of up to and mcluding $500,000. In addition,
descrepancss must include, without Emitation, those items and matters that require comrection in order for the aircraft to be gualified for issuance of a8 U.S. Certificate of Ainworthiness. if you are willing to
procaad on this basis, please so advise and | will move forward with the revisions to the proposad purchase agresment. Othenwise, | wish you kuck in negotisting from scratch with any potential potential
purchasers, and | will instruct the escrow agent to return our Depaait and negotiations will be terminated. | await your prompt reply.

Regards,

DARREM K. INDYKE
DARREM K. INDYHE, PLLC

The infosmation contained in this communication = confidential, may be attormey-client
prwvileged, and is mtendad only for the use of the addrassee. It is the property of

Darren K. indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication
of any part thereof i strictly prohibited and may be unlewful. i you have received this
communscation in eror, pleass notify ws immediately by return e-mail, and destray this
communscation and all copses theraof, including all attachments.

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - & 2016 Darren K.

Indyke, PLLC — All nghts resered.

On Oct 7, 2016, at 1:55 PM, Rob Dicastri <G -

M. Indyke,

Though we made it clear in our message that our offer was non-negotiable, our leadership has considered your proposal and will accept a price of 517m under the following conditions:
1. The purchase is on an "as =, where i5° basis &t AUH, and this will be reflected as the delivery condition in the purchase agreemsant

2. All rectification costs as a result of the pre-purchase inspection are therefore for the account of the buyer

3. The full purchasa price will therefore be paid to the seller's account by the buyer, without any deductions

4. The buyer will pay for the ferrying of the aircraft 1o the pre-purchase inspection facility at a full market charter rate

5. The above will be reflected in the purchase agreement to the seller's satisfaction within 14 days of thes message

Your representatives are well sware of the mechanical condition of the arcraft from their visits to our facilities, therefore this is & more than fair offer.

Wie require your acceptance or rejection of this offer immediately. otherwise we will proceed with other potential purchasers.

Wie look forward to recelving your response.

Riob D. DiCastn

EFTA01045763



President & CEOQ
Royal Jet LLC

On Oct 7, 2016, at 7:32 PM, Daren Indyke <|5EGNGGGG- vrote:

Dear Claira:

| have been matructed either to prepare a purchase agreement embcdying the 517 milion purchase price provided in my October 5 emal to you o to terminate negotigtions and withdraw Thomas
World Air, LLC'=Plan D, LLC's deposit. Please adwise how you wish for me to proceed. Thank you.

Regards,

DARREM K. INDYKE
DARREM K. INDYKE, PLLC

The informaton contained in this communscation k= confidential, may be attormey-client
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addresses. It is the property of

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication
or any par thereof is stictly prohibited and may be unlewful. If you hawve recelved this
cormmunication in error, please notify us mmediately by retwn e-mail, and destroy this
communication and all coples thereof, incleding sl attachments.

Copyright of Darren K. Indykea, FLLC - & 2016 Darren K.

Indyie, PLLC — All rights resenved.

On Oct 6, 2016, at 3:45 PM, Claire Brugirard <G - -

[De=ar Darren,

Yasterday's ernail is well received and has been shared with higher management.
Ve will come back to you as Soon & we hear from them with our feedback,

Best Regards,

Claire Brugirard

+ I

From: Darren Indyke

Sent: Thursday, October 6, 2016 23:41

Tao: Claire Brugirard

Cc: Larmy; Nelson, Michael; Rob DiCastri

Subject: Fe: BB] SN 30BEB4 [CC-MERC.FID1500434]

Dear Claire:

Pleass confem recaipt of my email of yesterday's date and adviss regarding the status of this matter. Thank you.

Regards,

DARREM K. IMDYKE
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC

The infarmation contained in this communication is confidential, meay be attorney-client
privileged, and ks intendsd only for the use of the addresses. It is the property of

Damen K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have recelved this
communication in ermoe, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments.

Cogpyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - & 2016 Damen k.

Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved.

On Oct 5, 2018, at 2:57 PM, Darren Indyke <||| NG »ot=:

Dear Claira:
Thank you for your atterngt &t & resolution of this matter.

If the purchase price is reducad to 517 milkon with the woodwork &s is, then we can move forward. Otherwise, you may consider Thomas World Air, LLC a/Plan D, LLC's offer terminated and
further negotiatons with reapect to the aircraft &t an end.

| appreciate your guick response and wish you luck if you decide to procesed with others.
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Regards,

DARREN K- INDYKE
DARREM F_ INDYKE. PLLC

The information contained in this cormmunication is confidential, may be attomey-clant
privileged, and ie intended only for the use of the addressea. It is the progerty of

Carren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorzed use, disclosure or copying of this communication
or any part thereaf is strctly prohibited and may be unlawiul. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by retum e-mail, and destroy this
communication and &ll coples thereof, includng all altachments.

Copynght of Dammen K- Indyke, PLLG - & 2016 Damen K.

Indyke, PLLC — All ights reserved.

On Oct 5, 2016, at 12-24 P Claire Brugirard <5zGGEEEEE - =

Dear Darren,
‘We have shared your message below with our leadership and are writing to communicate our position on this matter.

‘We do not believe that the offer made at USD 15,5 M reflects even close to the market value of the alrcraft in its current condition, and we are disappointed that your principle has decided at
this late stage to change his offer. As noted below, we were transparent throughout this process, and you sent Mr. Visoskl over here having received all of the correct information and the

feedback from your local representative. Even he initially expressed catisfaction with the interior and the technical condition of the aircraft, before then coming back to us with these new
issues.

Despite this, we are prepared to make an additional effort in erder to show our goodwill and close this deal.

‘We progose a final and non-negotiable offer as follows:

Option A: We maintain the price at USD 17.8 M, however Royal let commits to making basic "touch-ups” on the Interior woodwork at a gualified shop located here in Abu Dhabi.

iJlII‘lnI:LE:.‘ The aircraft ks purchased on an “as-is" basis {i.e. with the interior wood work in its current condition) in which case Royal Jet accepts to reduce the price to USD 17.5 M.

Please note that under both scenarios we will not accept any further reductions on the price even If after touch-up work is complete the result is still not to an "acceptable standard” according
to the buyer or the buyer's representative. Furthermore, only alrworthiness Issues will be addressed in the pre-purchase inspection process, and this will be reflected In the delivery condition

to be defined in the purchase agreement, which is to be executed by both parties before the aircraft Is sent for such inspection.

If the above s not acceptable to the buyer, he Is welcome to withdraw his deposit and we will re-open discussions with other prospective purchasers.

Given the work done by bath parties on this transaction so far, we hope it can still be completad, however we reguire the buyer's response by the close of business on Friday 7 October.
‘Wee look forward to recelving your response.
Best Regards

zimageddl.png=
Claire Brugirard
Sales Manager

B i Chabi, United Arst Emirates

From: Claire Brugirard

Sent: Monday, October 3, 2016 T:21 PM

To: Darren Indyke

Cez Larry; Melson, Michael

Subject: ke: BBJ 5N 30884 [CC-MERD.FID1500434]

Dear Darren,

Yaur email below has been shared with aur senior management.

They hawve a meeting this coming wednesday during which they will disouss this so | should have an answer by Wednesday evening aur time which & Wednesday morming your time.
Appraciate your patience and understanding.

Thanks

Bast Regards,
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Claire Brugirard

From: Darren Indyke

Sent: Thursday, September 29, 2016 20:04

To: Claire Brugirard

€z Larry; Nelson, Michasl

Subject: Re: BB] SN 30BB4 [CC-MERC.FID1S500434]

Diear Claire:

Thank you for your letber. We appreciate the spant in which it was writben, and we too would like 1o come 1o an understanding.

Howener, as the awyer for the principal of Thomas World Ak, LLE and Plan D, LLC, | feel obliged to point out the followsng:

1. We recetved nurmerous photographs from you detailing the intenor of the arcraft, and none of those photographs showed any of the wear and tear that was immediatley apparent upon a

visual mspection of the interiar.

2. We were mitally sent docurmnets that reflected the fact that one engine had only 4,400 hours on it and the other engine had 11,500 hours on . However, we are now advised that the first
engine actually has 6,600 hours on it and the other engine has 12 400 howrs on . Thus, these engines have a total of 3,100 more hours on thern than you initially represented 1o us. At our rate

af flying, this equates to approximately 4-5 more years of use than were lead to believe when we were negotiating the sales price.

In light of this, | am wnsure how we should proceed.  Candidly, my principal is very disappointad both by the change in information about the aircraft from that wiech was mitially conveyed o him
and with the expenses he has had to incur to date in order to uncover information that should heve been provided to him at the outset. | must also tell you that we have received a bid to refinish
the wood of approximately $1.25 millon. Moreover, owr consultants estimate another $1_25 million reduction in value as a result of the addibonal previously undisclosed engine wear and tear. |f

we are o persuade my principal to move forward, | believe that we could only do 8o at & new price of around 515.5 million.

| am hopeful that we can move forward at this price which better reflects the true condition of the aircraft. Howewer, Larry Visoski informa me that you have received two other offers on the

aircraft, and we will understand if you wish to pursue thoss instead.
Pleass let us know how you wish to proceed.

Regards,

DARREM K. INDYKE
DARREM K. IMDYHE, PLLC

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client
privileged, and is mtendead only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication
ar any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. i you have received this
commumscation in ermor, please notify ws immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this

commumscation and all coples thereof, including &ll attachments.
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - @ 2016 Darren K_
Indyki, PLLC — All righls reserved.

On Sep 29 2018, at 8:32 AW Claire Brugirard <{|5INNGEEEEEEEEE - -

Dear Darren,
Dear Larry,

Our Management has had a detailed meeting with our Chairman this afternoon in order to discuss this tophc.

‘We would like to clarify that Royal ket has been fully transparent with regards to the condition of the aircraft; the aircraft was made avallable for viewing twice for two different people who

each have made a different evaluation about the quality of the interior woodwork. We understand that this can happen since this is a subjective matter.

We would like to assure you of our intention to resolve this lssue together and find an agreement in order to move forward with the deal.

Since the guality of the interior woodwork on a pre-owned alrcraft will always be subject to various individual and personal opiniens and since it will be extremely difficult [and most likely an

open end) to define and agree together what would be the “acceptable standard” to which we would have to bring th

please note
The information contained in this communication 15
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and 15 intended only for
the use of the addressee. [t s the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication mn error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacationigmall.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all nghts reserved
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