From: "jeffrev E." <jeevacationiagmail com=

To: jet -
Subject: Re: BBI SN 30884 [CC-MERO FIDS00434]
Drate: Twe, 16 May 2007 22:41:58 +0000

Last email
On Wed, Mav 17, 2017 at 12:32 AM jeffrey E. <jeevacation(w pmail.com™ wrote:
Send only lady email to bob

------- Forwarded message --—-——

from: Lary - SR

Drate: Wed, May 17, 2007 at 12:26 AM

Subject: Ford: BBJ SN 30884 [CC-MERO FID1500434)

To: le vacation <jgevacationigmall.com=, Darren Indyvke _‘-‘

This email trail has some high points from past discussions with Clair and Husham

Darren Indyke

Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 12, 2016, at %:20 AM, Claire Brugirard </ | |GGG - ot

Dear Darren,
Our leadership has instructed me to send you our final offer as follows;

I.  The purchase price to remain at 1 7.5 M

2. The high time engine will be replaced with the original engine

3. The two additional aux fuel tanks which were recently located will be included in the loose equipment list

4. The pre-buy inspection and the delivery to be at Abu Dhabi International (Etihad Engineering) which is an MRO approved by both GCAA and
FAA, or within UAE as long as it is an FAA/GCAA approved facility audited by Royal Jet.

5. Royal Jet will be responsible for any discrepancies with the agreed cap of 500,000 above which Royal Jet can either elect to pay for the
discrepancies or to refund the pre-buy inspection costs

#.  Please note that Rovyal Jet will only address airworthy items and any cosmetic items shall not be considered as a discrepancy; as such there will
be no touch up work on the interior wood work done, and the condition of the woodwork should not be a reason for rejecting the aircraft

We do agree to include in the delivery condition that there shall be issued by the GCAA, in form and in substance satisfactory to the FAA, as determined by a
duly authorized designated airworthiness representative of the FAA selected by Purchaser in its discretion, an export certificate of airworthiness.

With regards to your request about items and matters that require correction in order for the aircraft to be qualified for issuance of a U.S. Certificate of
Adrworthiness; we fully realize that the intention is to register the aircraft in the USA, however, we would appreciate your understanding that we cannot
expose ourselves by committing to fulfilling requirements that are unknown to us. Therefore, and since the DAR would in any case be involved with the
issuance of the export certificate, we request that this item remains deleted as suggested in the last draft purchase agreement which was sent through (unless
there would be a way to know beforehand what such requirements would entail).

This offer is of course subject to agreeing and signing a binding purchase agreement between the parties and if the buyer is willing to proceed, then we would

request that the text of such purchase agreement is agreed upon no later than Thursday, 27'" October, 2016 (preferably before), and for the pre-buy inspection
to start as soon as possible thereafter.

We look forward to hearing from you soon.
Best Regards
<image00] . png=

Claire Brugirard
Sales Manager

Sent from my 1Pad

Begin forwarded message:

From: Manny Castanedo 4_:-
Drate: October 17, 2006 at 4:49:47 PM GMT+2
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To: Lyjct <[ GGG
Ce: mannyacefurbinepower.net,
subject: Re: BRI SN 30884 |[CC-MEROLFIDIS00434)

Larmry:
I'hanks, will review and advise.

Regards,

Manny

bMenay and Fraddy

attached i engine data for your evabuation,

#2 engne (3 onginal serlal number 888151 (s Installed on #2 posibon. has estimate 6200 hours total time. Mo shop visst,
#1 engne currently installed is senal 876170 Installed on &1 positon. has 12,400 hours fotal ime, has baen 1o shog.

iwe could install origingl enging senal number 883148 i w1 postion to replace BF6170) 8o that enging times are mose closely match, not exact. rather than having & 6000 hour engine, and a 12,000 hour engans
installed.

the original engine installed in #1 posdion senal ¥ 339148 was removed dus o matal in ol sarmghe from Gear box. and repained.,

we have the oplion to install this angmal engne back on the BEJ,. Seller Informs the margin an this engine |8 +35 degreas at Take-off EFR. the engune cumently installed has been 1o shop, with +40 degrea margn
according to Seller, with a +48 degrae margin in test cell,., but has 12,400 hourg since new. does [ make sende 1o install onginal engane, or 18 the parformace g0 much grester on the 12,400 hour serial 376170 that

we should keep this engne instaled?
need your advise please?

thank o,
Larry

--—-Onginal Message--——

From: Husham Osman
Ta: Larry o
Ce: Claire Brugirard = Darren indyke <] NG f=izon. Michesl <pMichasl Nalsonfclydeco.ae=

Sent: Mon, Oct 17, 2016 919 am
Subgect: BBJ 5N 30884 [CC-MERC.FID 5004.34]

Dear Larry

Please see attached my answers to the below points along with valid attachments. This should suffice the engineering consultant. If you have any guestions please do not hesitate to let us know
Bect regards

Best Regards,

<image00l png= <imagel02 gif*Husham Osman
Director Technica

B :-u Oheki, United Arab Emirates
I |

From: Larry [zl I

Sent: Friday, October 14, 2016 8:34 PM

Tae: Claire Brugirard; Husham Osman

Cc: Darren Indyke; Melson, Michael; Rob DiCastri
Suh]e:.t: Re: BBI SN 30834 |EE—MI’:HU.IIDI EUIJﬂ-E-d-]

Greetings Husham,

All s going well,.
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Can you provede the following info on the ongnal engine we are contermplating to install?

1-minipack of LSV for Review on engines

Mini-pack L5V attached for ESN BBE148

2-Request ECM

Latest ECM report of ESN B8E148 (original engine) and existing engines (876170 & 889151} Is attached.

3-was the engine test cell run after its Gear box repair?
If 50, I'll nead test cell results. please.
Yes, see summary performance attached

4- you menticn 35 degree margin at, What power satting?
EGT hot day Margin is given at TAKE OFF

S-Any and all info that | can fwd to my engimne personnel for evabeation.
odification Record of the original engine also attached for your review

6~ can you refresh my memory on Margin and test cell report of the 12400 howr engime currently nstalled on DFR.F
Please include best cell results on the 12,400 hour engine &s well for our comparison.
Tast Cell Margin was 490eg C. See attached 876170 Test Data. Current EGTM at takeoff ks ~ d0deg C

Best,
Larry

Sent from my iPad

On Oct 14, 2016, at 12:12 PM. Claire Brugirard < Ez_G__ - ot

Dear Darran,
De=ar Larry

Yaur rnesiage well received, | am glad we could come 1o an agreement and that we can praceed with the contract

Please bet us know exactly what information is required regarding the engines and the tanks so that we can ask aur technical team to préepare this
| suggest Mike to amend the katest draft APA with the agreed conditions and to send it through to you for review on Sunday ar Monday.

Best Regands,

Olaire Brugirard

From: Darren Indyke

Sent: Friday, October 14, 2016 19:46

To: Claire Brugirard

Cc: Rob DiCastri; Melson, Michasl; Larry

Subject: Re: BE] SN 30BE4 [CC-MERD.FIDS00434]

Dear Claire:

Let's proceed with the purchase agreement. We will need mose details conceming the engese, but this should not hold us up. Can you please provide us with the details for the two exira tanks so that we
may include descriptive information (L.e., seral numbers, etc.) in the purchase agreement. Thank you.

Best,

DARREM K. INDYHEE
DARREM K. INDYHKE, PLLC

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attonmey-client
privileged, and is mtendad only for the use of the addresses. It is the property of

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. i you have received this
commumscation in emor, please notify ws immediately by reburn e-mail, and destroy this
commumscation and all copses thereof, including all attachmenis.

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - & 2016 Darren K.

Indyke, FLLC — All rights resersed.

On 3ot 13, 2046, at 1:35 PM, Claire Brugirard <[ GGG =

Dear Darren, Larry

| am resending below message withaut the decument attached since | got an undediveratile message and am not sure | you got this.
Best Regards,

Claire Brugirard

N

From: Claire Brugirard

Sent: Thursday, October 13, 2016 15:28

Ta: Daren Indyke

Cc: Rob DiCastri; Nelson, Michael; Larry

Subject: RE: BB SN 30884 [CC-MERD.FID1500434]

Dear Darren,
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I am copying below the information recelved from our Director Technical which was also sent to Larry today;

The ariginal engine of AGDFR/1 - ESN BBEL4E (AGRIY/1 Ex-ABDFA] had a defect rectification shop wisit @ 4,499hrs/1,6690yc In Now 2013, See attached SV document
o AGBYTGE - Ovarhauled
o All other modules are not accessed

o Current EGT Margin = 35degC. The margin ks good enough to go another S4years based on RO fleet experience and current utilization rate.
o Current Time/Cycle = 5 951hrs/2 187 cyc

We will have to ground tw alroraft to perform the double engine swap which requires a lot or preparation, therefore we would request to do the engine change during the pre-buy here in Abu Dhabi.
If waur principal is ready to proceed with this offer then we would start planning this accordingly.
Given this additional effort we are hopeful that we can now come to an agreement together and we look forward to recelving your response.
Best Regards
<Imagedil.png=
Claire Brugirard

Sales Manager

I .t Chabi, United Arab Ernicates

From: Darren Indyke [mailto: G
Sent: Wednesday, October 12, 2016 11:06 FM

To: Clalre Brugirard

Ci: Rok DiCastri; Melson, Michael; Larry

Subject: Re: BE] SN 30884 [CC-MERDFIDL500434)

Claire:

Thank you for your emall. Wouwld you please send me the curment specs for the original engine that will replace the high tme engine.
Regards,

Drarren Indyke

Sent from my iPhone

0On Oct 12, 2016, at 8:20 A6, Claire Brugirard <G -

Dear Darren,
Our leadership has instructed me to send you our final offer as follows;

The purchase price to remain at 17.5 M

The high time engine will be replaced with the original engine

The two additional aux fuel tanks which were recently located will be Included in the loose eguipmenit list

. The pre-buy inspection and the delivery to be at Abu Dhabi International {Etihad Engineering) which ks an MRO approved by both GCAR and FAA, or within LIAE as long as it is an FAA/GCAA
apgroved facility audited by Royal Jet.

5. Hoyal Jet will be responsible for any discrepandes with the agreed cap of 500,000 above which Royal let can either elect to pay for the discrepancies or to refund the pre-buy inspection
CoEts

6. PFlease note that Royal Jet will only address alrworthy items and any cosmetic items shall not be considerad as a discrepancy; as such there will be no towch up work on the interior wood
wiork done, and the condition of the woodwork should not be a reason for rejecting the aircraft

PN E U N

We do agree to include in the delivery condition that there shall be issued by the GCAR, in form and in substance satisfactory to the FAA, as determined by a duly authorized designated alrworthiness
representative of the FAA selected by Purchaser In its discretion, am export certificate of alrworthiness.

‘With regards to your request about Items and matters that require correction in order for the alrcraft to be gualified for ssuance of a U5, Certificate of Alrworthiness; we fully realize that the intention is
to register the alrcraft in the USA, however, we would appreciate your understanding that we cannot expose ourselves by committing to fulfilling requirements that are unknown to us. Therefore, and
since the DAR would in any case be involved with the Issuance of the export certificate, we request that this itermn remains deleted as suggested in the last draft purchase agreement which was sent
through {unless there would be a way to know beforehand what such requirements would entall).

This affer is of course subject to agreeing and signing a binding purchase agreament between the parties and if the buyer is willing to proceed, then we would request that the text of such purchase
agreement Is agreed upon no later than Thursday, 27" Bctober, 2018 |preferably before), and for the pre-buy Inspection to start as soon as possible thereafter.

We look forward to hearing from you soon.
Best Regards
<imageddl_png=

Clalre Brugirard
Sales Manager

I b Chiabi, United Arab Ermirates
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From: Darren Indyke [mailo | GG

Sent: Wednesday, October 12, 2016 12:10 AM

Ta: Claire Brugirard

Ce: Rob DWCastr; Melson, Michael; Lanry

Subject: Re: BEJ SN 30884 [CC-MERQ.FID15004:34)

Dear Clasre:

| understand that Royal Jet has mede a revised offer, which is to to replace the high time engine on the asrcraft with the original engine that was previously replaced and 1o inchede two extra fuel tanks, 1o
sat the purchase prce &t $17.5 Million, and to hawe the pre-buy inspection take place at a facility in the UAE. |s this correct? Please advise.

Thank you.

Regards,

DARREM K. INDYKE
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC

The information contained in this communication i confidential, may be attomey-cleant
privilaged, and is intendad only for the wse of the addressse. It is the property of

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication
of any part thereof k= strictly prohibited and may be unlewful. If you have received this
communication in error, pleass notify us immediately by reben e-mail, and destroy this
communication and all coplea thereof, incleding all attachments.

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, FLLC - & 2016 Darren K.

Indyke, FLLC — All nghts resansed.

On Oct 10, 2016, at 1:47 FM, Darmen Indyle <{|EGNGNGTG. ot

Drear M. DiCastri:

Inasrmuch as Royal Jet has already agreed to be responsible for up to 5500,000 of discrepancies noted during the pre-purchase inspection, your emal below is clearly a move in the wrong direction.
However, we are prepared to offer Royal Jet, LLC $17.2 milien on the same terms as previously agreed without & reguiremant that you restore the woodwork to an acceptable condition. This absolutety
requires you 1o address discrepancies at youwr cost and requires you 1o pay our inspection fees and costs should you refuse or fail to correct dacrepances of up 1o and including $500,000. In addition,
discrepancies must nclude, withouwt limitation, those fems and matters that require correction in order for the aircraft to be gualified for issuance of a U.5. Certificate of Airworthiness. If you are willing to
proceed on this basks, please so advise and | will move forward with the revisions to the proposed purchase agreement. Otherwise, | wish you luck in negotiating from scratch with any potential potential
purchasers, and | will instruct the escrow agent to retwrn our Deposit and negotiations will be terminated. | await your prompt reply.

Regards,

DARREM K. INDYKE
DARREM K. INDYKE, PLLC

Tre information contained in thie communication e confidential, may be attorney-client
privileged, and is intended anly for the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Drasren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication
or any part thereof is striclly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have recalved this
communication in emor, please motify us iImmediately by return e-mail, and desiroy this
communication and all copies thereof, including &ll attachments.

Copyright of Damen K. Indyke, PLLC - @ 2016 Damren Ko

Indiykie, PLLC — All righta reserved.

On Oct 7, 2006, at 1:55 PM, Rob Dicastd <IN -

Mr. Indyke,

Though we made it clear in our measage that our offer was non-negotiable, owr leadership has considered your progosal and will accept a price of 517m under the following conditions:

. The purchase is on an “as is, where is" basis at ALUH, and this will be reflected as the delivery condition in the purchase agreement
. Al rectification costs as & result of the pre-purchase mspecton are therefore for the accownt of the buyer

. The full purchase price will therefore be padd to the seller's account by the buyer, without any deductions

. The buyer will pay for the ferrying of the arcraft to the pre-purchase inspection facility at & full market charter rate

. The abowve will be reflected in the purchase agreement to the seller's satisfection within 14 days of this messags

O B L B3 =

Your representatives are well aware of the mechanical conditson of the aircraft from their wisits to our facilities, therefore thes is & more than faer offer.
We require your acceptance or rejection of this offer immediately, othersise we will proceed with other potential purchasers.

We look forward 1o recelving your resgonsea.

EFTA01045771



FRob D. DiCastn
President & CEO
Royal Jet LLC

On Oct 7, 2016, at 7:33 PM, Darren Indyke <N ot

Diear Claire:

| hawe been instructed either to prepare a purchase agreement embodying the 317 millon purchase price provided in my October 5 emal to you o to terminate negotiations and withdraw Thomas
Ward Asr, LLC's/Plan D, LLC's deposit. Please advise how you wish for me to procesd. Thank you.

Regards,

DARREM K. INDYHKE
DARREM K. INDYHKE, PLLC

The infarmation contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client
privileged, and ks intendad only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Darren K- Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. if you have received this
commamnication in emmor, please notify ws immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this
communication and all copses thereof, including &ll attachments.

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - & 2016 Darren K.

Indyke, PLLC — All rights resersed.

On Ot &, 2018, at 3:45 PM, Claire Brugirard <[ NG - -

Dear Darren,

Yesterday's emai is well received and has been shared with higher management.
W will come back to you as soon as we hear from them with our fesdback.

flest Regards,

Claire Brugirard
5|

From: Darren Indyke

Sent: Thursday, October &, 2016 23:41

To: Claire Brugirard

Ce: Lamy; Melson, Michael; Rob DeCastri

Subject: Re: BE] SM 30834 [CC-MERO. FID1500434]

Dear Claire:
PFlease confirm receipt of my email of yesterday’s date and advise regarding the status of this matter. Thank you.

Regards,

DARREM K. INDYKE
DARREM K_INDYKE. PLLC

The nformation contained in this communication is confidential, may be attormey-client
privileged. and is intended only for the use of the addressesa. it is the property of

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorzed use, dsdosure or copying of this communication
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have receved this
communication in error, pease notify us iImmedately by retum e-mad, and destroy this
communication and &ll copies thereof, including all attachments.

Copynght of Damren K. Indyke, PLLC - @ 2016 Darren K.

Indyke, PLLC - ANl rights resarved.

On Oct 8, 2016, at 257 PM, Darren Indyke <|NGG- ot

Dear Clasre:
Thank you for your atternpt at a resolution of this matter.

If the purchase price is reduced to 317 milion with the woodwork &s is, then we can move forward. Otherwise, you may consider Thomas World Air, LLC's/Plan D, LLC's offer terminated amd
further megotiations with respsact to the aircraft at an end.

EFTA01045772



| apprecate your quick response and wish you keck if you decide to proceed with others.

Regards,

DARREM K. INDYKE
DARREM K. INDYHE, PLLC

The infosmation contained in this communication s confidential, may be attorney-client
privileged, and is mtended only for the use of the addressee. Itis the property of

Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this commusnication
or any part theraof i strictly prohibited and may be unlewful. If you hawve recelved this
cormmunscation in error, please notify us immediately by reten e-mail, and destroy this
commumscation and all copses theraof, including all attachments.

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - & 2016 Darren K.

Indyke, FLLC — All nghts resered.

On Ot 5, 2016, at 12:24 PM, Claire Brugirard <G -

Diear Darren,

‘\We have shared your rmessage below with our leadership and are writing to communicate cur position on this matter.

‘\We do not believe that the offer made at USD 15,5 M reflacts even close to the market value of the alrcraft in its current condition, and we are disapgointed that your principle has decided at
this late stage to change his offer. As noted below, we were transparent throughout this process, and you sent Mr. Visoskl over here having received all of the correct Information and the
feedback from your local representative. Even he initially expressed satisfaction with the interior and the technical condition of the aircraft, before then coming back to us with these new
Issues.

Daspite this, we are prepared to make an additional effort In order to show our goodwill and close this deal.

‘We propose a final and nen-negotiable offer as follows:

Option A: We maintaln the price at USD 17.8 M, however Royal Jet commits to making baskc "touch-ups” on the Interior woodwaork at a gualified shop located here in Abu Dhabi.

Dption B: The alrcraft is purchased on an "as-is" basls (i.e. with the interior wooed work In its current condition) in which case Royal let accepts to reduce the price to USD 17.5 M.
Please note that under both scenarios we will not accept any further reductions an the price even If after touch-up work ks complete the result is still not to an “acceptable standard” according
to the buyer or the buyer's representative. Furthermore, only alrworthiness issues will be addressed in the pre-purchase inspection process, and this will be reflected in the delivery condition

to be defined in the purchase agreement, which is to be executed by both parties before the aircraft Is sent for such inspection.

If the abowe is not acceptable to the buyer, he ks welcome to withdraw his deposit and we will re-apen discussions with other prospective purchasers.

Given the work done by both parties on this transaction so far, we hope it can still be completed, however we reguire the buyer's response by the close of business on Friday 7P ctober
‘We look forward to recelving your response.
Best Regards
<lmagelll.prg=
Clalire Bruglrard

Sales Manager

I /tu Chabi, United Arab Emicates

From: Claire Brugirard

Sent: Monday, October 3, 2016 7:21 PM

To: Darren Indyke

Ce: Larry; Nelson, Michael

Subject: Re: BEJ 5N 30884 [CC-MERO.FID1500434)

Dhar ' Drnrresn,

Your ernail below has been sharsd with owr senior managernent.

They have a meeting this coming wednesday during which they will disouss this so | should have an answer by Wednesday evening our time which & Wednesday marming your time.
Appredate yaur patience and underatanding.

Thanks

Best Regards,

EFTA01045773



Claire Brugirard
+

From: Darren [ndyke

Sent: Thursday, Sepbember 29, 2016 20:04

To: Oaire Brugirard

€c: Lamy; Nelson, Michael

Subject: Re: BB] SM 30884 [CC-MERC.FID1500434]

Dear Claire:

Thank you for your ketter. We appreciate the spirit in which it was written, and we tod would Bke to come 1o an understanding.

Howewer, as the lawyer for the principal of Thomas Word Air, LLC and Plan D, LLC, | feel obliged to point out the following:

1. We received numerous photographs from you detalling the interior of the sircraft, and nome of those photographs showed any of the wear and tear that was immediatiey apparent upon &

wiaual inspection of the interior.

2. Woe were initally sent docurnnets that reflected the fact that one engine had only 4,400 hours on it and the other engine had 11,500 hows on . However, we are now advised that the first
engine actually has 6,600 hours on it and the other engine has 12,400 hours on it. Thus, these engines have a total of 3,100 more hours on themn than you initially represented to us. At our rate

of flying, this equates to approximately 4-5 more years of use than were lead to believe when we were negotiating the sales price.

Im light of this, | @am unsure how we showld proceed.  Candidly, my principal Is very disappointed bath by the change in information about the aircraft from that which was initially corveyed ta him
and with the expenses he has had to incur to date in order to uncover information that should heve been provided to him at the outset. | must also tell you that we heve recerved & bed to refinish
the wood of apprommately $1.25 millon. Moreover, our consultants estimate another $1.25 milion reduction in value &s a result of the additional praviously undisclosed engine wear and tear. |If

we are to persuade my principal to move forward, | believe that we could only do 8o &t & new price of around 5$15.5 million.

| am hopeful that we can move forward at this price which better reflects the true condition of the aircraft. Howewer, Larry Visoski informa me that you hawve received two other offers on the

aircraft, and we will understand if you wish to pursue those nstesd.

Please ket us know how you wish to procesd.

Regards,

DARREM K. INDYKE
DARREM K. INDYEE, PLLC

The information contained in thie communication (e confidential, may be attormey-client
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Drarren K. Indyke, FLLC. Unauthorzed vse, discosure or copying of this communicetion
or any part thereof is etricly prohibited and may ke unlawful. If you have recalved this
communication in emor, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this

communication and all copies thereof, including all attechments.
Caopyright of Daren K. Indyke, PLLC - © 2016 Darren K.
Indiybe, PLLC — AN rights reservad.

On Sep 28, 2016, at 8-32 AM, Claire Brugirard <G - -

Dear Darren,
Dear Larry,

Qur Managernent has had a detailed meeting with our Chairman this afternoon in order to discuss this topic.

‘Wi would like to clarify that Royal Jet has been fully transparent with regards to the condition of the aircraft; the alrcraft was made avallable for viewing twice for two different people who

each have made a different evaluation about the quality of the interior woodwork. We understand that this can happen since this is a subjective matter

‘We wiould like to assure you of our intention to resolve this issue together and find an agreerment in order to move forward with the deal.

Since the quality of the interior woodwork on a pre-owned alrcraft will always be subject to various individual and personal opiniens and since it will be extremely difficutt (and most likely an

open end) to define and agree together what would be the "acceptable standard” to which we would have to bring th

please note
The information contained mn this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute mside information, and 15 imtended only for

the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof 15 strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. 1f vou have recerved this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
retumn e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationigmall.com, and

destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

please note
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The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attomey-client pnvileged, may
consttute inside information, and s intended only for
the use of the addressee. [t s the property of

JEE

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or amy part thereof is strictly prohibited
and mav be unlawiul. If you have received this
communication in ermor, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by c-mail to jeevacation(wgmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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